
BULB COST INCLUDING LABOR TO REPLACE 
Illuminations 
by Greenlee

NRG 
Conservation

Groves 
Electrical

Johnson 
Electric 
Company

Environmental 
Lighting Service

Al Faiz 
Electric

F22DTT/2 pin fluorescent 9.50$                39.96$                36.00$                31.24$                  49.42$                      no bid
CDM 35/ar30L/SP Par 20 70.00$              61.00$                65.00$                52.60$                  72.50$                      no bid
CDM35/PAR/M/FL Par 20 70.00$              78.53$                65.00$                52.60$                  72.50$                      no bid
MC39T6/U/G12/830 62.00$              62.67$                65.00$                52.60$                  77.22$                      no bid
Compact Florescent Med Base 14w R style 10.50$              37.62$                30.00$                30.30$                  50.53$                      no bid
Compact Florescent Med Base 16w R style 11.25$              38.63$                30.00$                30.30$                  47.22$                      no bid
Compact Florescent Med Base 23w R style 12.75$              43.44$                30.00$                30.30$                  56.65$                      no bid
Compact Florescent Med Base 14w E26 12.50$              32.93$                30.00$                24.19$                  43.50$                      no bid
Compact Florescent Med Base 23w E26 13.60$              32.77$                30.00$                24.78$                  44.73$                      no bid
Compact Florescent Med Base 30w E26 12.00$              41.71$                30.00$                27.83$                  49.05$                      no bid
60w Candelabra Base Long Life Incandescent 7.50$                30.66$                20.00$                20.89$                  41.85$                      no bid
70w MH E17 45.00$              43.46$                35.00$                37.25$                  55.23$                      no bid
70w Moon Pulse 21.40$              61.50$                50.00$                37.25$                  52.50$                      no bid
75w/100w PAR 38 exterior flood 10.71$              33.88$                20.00$                51.05$                  50.92$                      no bid
75w/100w LED PAR 38 flood equivalents 51.00$              50.99$                45.00$                51.05$                  70.00$                      no bid
100w MH E17 Clear 45.00$              45.69$                35.00$                37.25$                  74.58$                      no bid
100w MH M90 Clear 38.60$              42.76$                35.00$                37.25$                  73.80$                      no bid
MP100/C/U/MED 21.40$              42.50$                35.00$                39.41$                  57.73$                      no bid
100w Moon Pulse 100/C/U/MED E17 32.00$              45.04$                40.00$                39.84$                  55.62$                      no bid
100w R40 Mercury Vapor 43.50$              62.03$                50.00$                47.00$                  56.22$                      no bid
100w Moon Pulse R40 25.60$              47.20$                50.00$                47.00$                  56.22$                      no bid
MXR100/C/U/MED/0 12579 18.50$              50.80$                40.00$                48.73$                  68.33$                      no bid
150w MH E17 45.25$              48.08$                35.00$                37.25$                  73.80$                      no bid
175w MH E28 59.51$              55.95$                35.00$                33.75$                  62.38$                      no bid
175w-ED-17MH 53.00$              49.57$                40.00$                38.01$                  54.65$                      no bid
175W R40 Mercury Vapor 45.25$              60.50$                50.00$                47.32$                  50.30$                      no bid
250w MH E28 30.25$              109.45$              35.00$                33.75$                  54.58$                      no bid
Q1000 PAR 64 MFL 43498 7.50$                120.78$              30.00$                38.62$                  319.12$                    no bid
1000/HOR/BT37 20.00$              151.18$              60.00$                113.44$                82.67$                      no bid
1000w MH E28 mogul base 43.00$              128.14$              100.00$              59.66$                  71.32$                      no bid
400w MH mogul base 28.00$              43.12$                35.00$                42.71$                  54.92$                      no bid
20w G4 9.75$                35.99$                25.00$                23.28$                  47.07$                      no bid
50W E-17 MH 29.00$              50.43$                35.00$                37.25$                  55.23$                      no bid
50w MR16/low voltage halogen 24.00$              34.50$                25.00$                25.11$                  44.50$                      no bid
LED equivalent for 50w MR16/low voltage halogen 49.00$              42.00$                35.00$                43.00$                  60.00$                      no bid
20w MR16/low voltage halogen 23.00$              38.00$                25.00$                25.11$                  44.50$                      no bid
LED equivalent for 20w MR16/low voltage halogen 48.50$              42.00$                -$                    40.85$                  55.00$                      no bid
MVR 50/U/MED E17 17.50$              49.20$                40.00$                37.25$                  57.08$                      no bid
HR 175 R40 clear 21.00$              42.30$                50.00$                47.37$                  50.30$                      no bid
Quartz Filament Style 8.50$                36.50$                20.00$                26.47$                  45.50$                      no bid
Encapsulated String Lights 7.50$                40.00$                50.00$                273.90$                50.00$                      no bid
50W T4 GY6.35 7.50$                35.00$                25.00$                23.28$                  47.07$                      no bid
39w T8 MC39 83.50$              80.00$                200.00$              52.60$                  82.92$                      no bid
150CHMTG 56.00$              50.00$                110.00$              52.60$                  61.50$                      no bid
50 watt Moon Pulse 21.00$              47.00$                50.00$                39.54$                  55.23$                      no bid
CREE 47w E-WP8 LED 53.60$              81.97$                230.00$              168.32$                206.67$                    no bid

BALLAST/TRANSFORMER/DRIVER COST 
INCLUDING LABOR TO REPLACE ONE EACH ONE EACH ONE EACH ONE EACH ONE EACH ONE EACH

35/39 watt Metal Halide ballast P.S. 60.21$              65.00$                135.00$              115.09$                181.11$                    no bid
35/39 watt Metal Halide electronic ballast 122.75$            65.00$                160.00$              192.25$                212.46$                    no bid
50 watt Metal Halide ballast P.S. 70.21$              65.00$                90.00$                96.85$                  142.67$                    no bid
70 watt Metal Halide ballast P.S. 80.00$              65.00$                90.00$                109.14$                144.33$                    no bid
100 watt Metal Halide ballast P.S. 75.00$              65.00$                90.00$                102.77$                139.64$                    no bid
100 watt Metal Halide electronic ballast 105.00$            70.00$                150.00$              192.25$                224.30$                    no bid
150 watt Metal Halide ballast P.S. 75.00$              70.00$                90.00$                113.41$                167.00$                    no bid
175 watt Metal Halide ballast P.S. 80.00$              70.00$                95.00$                118.14$                162.90$                    no bid
175 watt Metal Halide ballast non-pulse 65.50$              70.00$                95.00$                102.77$                131.63$                    no bid
250 watt Metal Halide ballast non-pulse 61.25$              150.00$              100.00$              116.79$                135.00$                    no bid
1000 watt Metal Halide ballast non-pulse 98.75$              147.00$              200.00$              167.81$                199.14$                    no bid
120/208/240/277 volt multi-tap ballast 64.25$              147.00$              200.00$              167.81$                191.91$                    no bid
480 volt ballast 79.25$              77.00$                200.00$              167.81$                199.14$                    no bid
26 watt fluorescent transformer 34.25$              69.00$                60.00$                68.92$                  101.36$                    no bid
1000 watt 6volt low voltage multi-tap transformer 12.00$              77.00$                140.00$              280.17$                580.00$                    no bid
50 watt low voltage multi-tap transformer 38.25$              79.00$                120.00$              121.61$                251.43$                    no bid
LED LSI driver 200w in/175w out IP65 110.00$            105.00$              220.00$              240.55$                494.29$                    no bid

TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
Total of single bulb & single ballast/transformer/ 2,667.09$         3,953.43$           4,441.00$           4,685.29$            6,720.94$                 200.00$            
driver unit costs

Cost of changing all the timers for Daylight Savings Time  750.00$            600.00$              784.00$              2,600.00$            2,000.00$                 20,000.00$      
(Pricing should reflect the total for both Fall and Spring Daylight Savings 

Labor for misc. electrical repairs 45.00$              30.00$                60.00$                80.00$                  75.00$                      6.00$                /man hour
(Use Journeyman electrical rate) per man hour

Parts for misc. electrical repairs - Contractor's cost plus markup 18% 15% 15% 10% 25% 0%



/man hour


