
           

Post Office Box 9010 Addison, Texas
75001-9010

5300 Belt Line Road
(972) 450-7000 Fax: (972) 450-7043 

AGENDA

REGULAR MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL

AND / OR

WORK SESSION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

6:00 PM

September 23, 2014

ADDISON TOWN HALL

5300 BELT LINE RD., DALLAS, TX 75254
6:00PM WORK SESSION

7:30PM REGULAR MEETING
             

WORK SESSION
 

WS1   Discussion regarding the Vision Statement for the Town of Addison.
 

Attachments
Draft Vision Statement

 

WS2   Update and discussion regarding the Addison Conference and
Theatre Centre catering policies.

 

REGULAR MEETING
 



Pledge of Allegiance
 

R1   Announcements and Acknowledgements regarding Town and Council
Events and Activities

Discussion of Events/Meetings
 

R2   Consent Agenda.
 

R2a   Approval of the Minutes for the September 9, 2014 City Council
Meeting and Work Session.

 

  RECOMMENDATION:
 

  Administration recommends approval.
 

Attachments
09-09-2014 Minutes

 

R2b   Approval of an Ordinance amending Chapter 38 (Fire Prevention and
Protection) of the Code of Ordinances by amending various sections
thereof regarding the International Fire Code, and adopting the
International Fire Code (IFC) 2012 Edition (and certain appendices
thereto) and making such other changes and providing for other
provision regarding and relating to the International Fire Code as set
forth in the Ordinance.

 

  RECOMMENDATION:
 

  Administration recommends approval.
 

Attachments
Fire Code Amendments Ordinance
2012 IFC Changes

 

R2c   Approval of Ordinances amending Chapter 18 (Buildings and
Building Regulations) of the Code of Ordinances by amending
various sections thereof regarding:

The International Building Code, and adopting the International
Building Code, 2012 Edition (and certain appendices thereto)
and making other changes to the International Building Code as

1.



set forth in the Ordinance.
The International Residential Code, and adopting the
International Residential Code, 2012 Edition (and certain
appendices thereto) and making other changes to the
International Residential Code as set forth in the Ordinance.

2.

The International Energy Conservation Code, and adopting the
International Energy Conservation Code, 2012 Edition and
making other changes to the International Energy Conservation
Code as set forth in the Ordinance.

3.

The International Property Maintenance Code, and adopting the
International Property Maintenance Code, 2012 Edition and
making other changes to the International Property Maintenance
Code as set forth in the Ordinance.

4.

The Electrical Code, and the National Electrical Code, and
adopting the National Electrical Code, 2014 Edition and making
other changes to the Electrical Code and National Electrical
Code as set forth in the Ordinance.

5.

The International Plumbing Code, and adopting the International
Plumbing Code, 2012 Edition and making other changes to the
International Plumbing Code as set forth in the Ordinance.

6.

The International Mechanical Code, and adopting the
International Mechanical Code, 2012 Edition and making other
changes to the International Mechanical Code as set forth in the
Ordinance.

7.

 

  RECOMMENDATION:
 

  Administration recommends approval.
 

Attachments
2012 IBC MEMO
2012 IBC ORD
2012 IRC MEMO
2012 IRC ORD
2012 IPMC MEMO
2012 IPMC ORD
2014 NEC MEMO
2014 NEC ORD
2012 IPC MEMO
2012 IPC ORD
2012 IMC MEMO
2012 IMC ORD



 

R2d   Approval of an Ordinance amending the Code of Ordinances of the
Town by amending Chapter 66 (Solid Waste) Article II (Collection
and Disposal), Division 2 (Service Charge) by amending Section
66-52 increasing from $12.56 to $12.77 the monthly fee for single
family residential garbage collection.

 

  RECOMMENDATION:
 

  Administration recommends approval.
 

Attachments
Solid Waste Fee Ordinance

 

R2e   Approval of and authorizing the City Manager to enter into an
interlocal agreement with Dallas County in an amount not to exceed
$10,000 for the disposal of Household Hazardous Waste.

 

  RECOMMENDATION:
 

  Administration recommends approval.
 

Attachments
HHW ILA

 

R2f   Approval of and authorizing the City Manager to execute a renewal
contract with Cobb Fendley & Associates, Inc., to provide
professional engineering services; to authorize additional renewals;
and to approve a not to exceed amount of $100,000.

 

  RECOMMENDATION:
 

  Administration recommends approval.
 

R2g   Approval of and authorizing the City Manager to execute a contract
with Elite Tree Service for annual city-wide tree trimming services in
an amount not to exceed $65,000.

 

  RECOMMENDATION:
 

  Administration recommends approval.
 



Attachments
Bid Tabulation Form

 

R2h   Approval of and authorizing the City Manager to enter into a license
agreement with Kennington Surveyor Ltd.(or appropriate property
owner) for the use of the property located adjacent to and along the
southwest corner of the intersection of Arapaho Road and Surveyor
Boulevard for the Redding Trail Expansion.

 

  RECOMMENDATION:
 

  Administration recommends approval.
 

Attachments
KJA Subdivision, Part 2 - Location Map
KJA Subdivision, Part 2 - Property Survey
KJA Subdivision, Part 2 - Proposed Trail Exhibit
KJA Subdivision, Part 2 - Trail Map with Property Identified
Pedestrian Connectivity Project Map

 

Regular Items
 

R3   Discussion, consider and take action regarding appointment of a
Member to the Planning and Zoning Commission.

 

R4   Discussion and update regarding Oncor service reliability efforts in
the Town of Addison.

 

R5   Presentation, discussion, consider and take action regarding the
approval of an Ordinance amending the Code of Ordinances of the
City by amending Chapter 82(Utilities), Article I (In General), Division
5 (Rates and Charges) by amending Section 82-76 and Section
82-77 increasing sewer and water rates for all customer
classifications.

 

  RECOMMENDATION:
 

  Administration recommends approval.
 

Attachments
Utility Rate Ordinance (Marked)



 

R6   Presentation and discussion regarding an update on the Finance
Department Work Plan.

 

Attachments
Finance Work Plan Memo
Work Plan

 

R7   Discussion, consider and take action regarding approval of and
authorizing the City Manager to execute a contract with Artistic
Painting Company for city-wide painting services in an amount not to
exceed $200,000 for painting of the Wheeler Bridge, Blueprints
sculpture, interior Athletic Club areas and park structures, and
discussion regarding traffic control during periods of painting.

 

  RECOMMENDATION:
 

  Administration recommends approval.
 

Attachments
2-Part Coating System

 

R8   Discussion, consider and take action regarding approval of and
authorizing the City Manager to execute a Project Specific
Agreement with Dallas County for the Redding Trail Expansion.

 

  RECOMMENDATION:
 

  Administration recommends approval.
 

Attachments
Dallas County PSA
Pedestrian Connectivity Project Map
Proposition 6 CIP Funds

 

R9   Discussion, consider and take action regarding the Vision Statement
for the Town of Addison.

 

Executive Session
 

ES1   Closed (Executive) session of the Addison City Council pursuant to



ES1   Closed (Executive) session of the Addison City Council pursuant to
Section 551.087, Texas Government Code, to discuss or deliberate
regarding commercial or financial information that the City Council
has received from a business prospect or business prospects that
the City Council seeks to have locate, stay, or expand in our near the
territory of the Town of Addison and with which the City Council is
conducting economic development negotiations, and/or to deliberate
the offer of a financial or other incentive to such business prospect or
business prospects.

 

Regular Items Continued
 

R10   Discussion, consider and take action regarding commercial or
financial information that the City Council has received from a
business prospect or business prospects that the City Council seeks
to have locate, stay, or expand in or near the territory of the Town of
Addison and with which the City Council is conducting economic
development negotiations, and/or any action regarding the offer of a
financial or other incentive to such business prospect or business
prospects.

 

  RECOMMENDATION:
 

  Administration recommends approval.
 

Adjourn Meeting
 

 

Posted:
Matthew McCombs, September 19, 2014, 5:00pm

THE TOWN OF ADDISON IS ACCESSIBLE TO PERSONS WITH DISABILITIES.
PLEASE CALL (972) 450-7090 AT LEAST

48 HOURS IN ADVANCE IF YOU NEED ASSISTANCE.



   
Combined Meeting   WS2           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Create raving fans of the Addison Experience.
Maintain and enhance our unique culture of creativity and
innovation.
Brand Protection and Enhancement
Look for Operational Efficiencies without cutting services
Explore new/other revenue sources

AGENDA CAPTION:
Update and discussion regarding the Addison Conference and Theatre Centre
catering policies.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
N/A

BACKGROUND:
The purpose of this item is to update the City Council on the in-house caterer and
current catering policies at the Addison Conference and Theatre Centre.

With a desire and direction to generate more revenue and operate to compete
with private event venues, the catering policy changed in September of 2012
when the City Council approved an amendment to the Code of Ordinances. The
idea was to become more competitive by being more of a one-stop-shop for event
venue needs by offering more competitive pricing, total catering solutions, and the
Addison Way customer experience. Specifically, the City Council approved
Section 67-15A, which provided for 1) the ACTC and Visit Addison take a
commission from licensed food and beverage caterers, and 2) select an in-house
private label caterer to provide packages and an overall food and beverage total
solution for clients. Implementation immediately followed resulting in several
changes:

Any caterer of the client’s choosing was allowed to operate, provided the
caterer signed an agreement that included having the proper insurance
requirements and paying the venue a commission based on gross sales. The
commission structure was 10% for Addison hotels, 15% for Addison
restaurants and caterers, and 20% for non-Addison caterers. Once the
requirements were met and the agreement was signed, the vendor was
approved. The idea of allowing the client to choose any caterer was to satisfy
the diverse needs of clients where a particular meal offering or preparation
was required. 

1.



Once approved, the caterer was added to an Approved Caterer List and
clients chose from any number of vendors on this list. 

2.

If a client wished to utilize a caterer that was not or could not be approved, or
was considered a fast-casual food service, i.e. Jason’s Deli, Pizza Hut, the
client would be charged a “Buy-out Fee”. These fees are standard in the
event venue industry and are a way to encourage the client to used the
approved or exclusive caterer(s) for the venue and collect revenue absent a
commission. Buy-out fees differ amongst venues; for example, fees can be
flat and wide-ranging, or based on group sizes or charged per attendee. 

3.

The ACTC operated with the above structure as a means to ease into the process
and also make things more palatable for repeat clients, although most expect
there to be a charge for catering or buy-out fee to utilize outside caterers.
However, this also resulted in more time being spent administrating the various
contracts, collecting payments, and also was less turn-key for the clients. 

After reviewing the cost-benefit of the above structure, it became evident that the
process needed to be streamlined and turn-key for both the ACTC and clients by
instituting the in-house caterer. That process began on July 1st of this year with a
Request for Proposal being placed on Bidsync (web-based government
e-procurement/bidding solution) and with an email notification sent to local
caterers on July 7th encouraging them to apply. When bidding closed on July
17th, we received proposals from the following: Blue Mesa, Chef Pete Catering,
Spice of Life Catering, My House Catering, and Culinary Art Catering. 

The selection process involved three steps. The first step was an evaluation of the
proposals, including the following on a weighted scale: Completeness of Proposed
Solution, Food Tasting and Presentation, Commission Percentage, Reference
Checks. The second evaluation was a tasting and presentation held at the
Conference Centre on August 6-8. The final evaluation was a supplemental of
menus and answers to questions regarding marketing and processes, which were
due on August 18 th. 

A final decision was made on August 20th to move forward with Culinary Art
Catering as the exclusive in-house caterer for the ACTC. The final decision was
based on the following criteria:

quality of food & presentation
level of customer/client service
price point for the client
commission offered to ACTC and Visit Addison
current and future marketing capabilities to target markets
menu flexibility & creativity
timeliness/punctuality



timeliness/punctuality
reference checks

As of today, the catering policy is as follows:

Clients have the option to utilize the exclusive caterer of the ACTC1.
Clients have the option to utilize any caterer of their choice, outside of the
exclusive caterer, with a charge of $8.00 per head on the day of the event. A
survey was done in May of 2014 and found that several competitors within a
10 mile radius charge different buy-out fees: 

Crown Plaza (Addison): $25 per attendee1.
Marriot (Addison): $40 per attendee2.
Intercontinental (Addison): $40 per attendee3.
Richardson Civic Center: $300 flat fee4.
Plano Centre: exclusive, no outside catering allowed5.

2.

The current structure and policy is a more efficient and effective approach, offering
a total catering solution for the client and the ACTC operations. The client now has
a wide variety of meals and packages to select from with a proven, reputable
caterer, historically serving the targeted corporate and social markets of the
ACTC. The ACTC benefits by primarily coordinating with one caterer, significantly
reducing administration time, and collecting a favorable commission of all food
and beverage sales. Clients who wish to use any outside caterer of their choosing
may do so with the buy-out fee.

RECOMMENDATION:



   
Combined Meeting   WS1           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: N/A

AGENDA CAPTION:
Discussion regarding the Vision Statement for the Town of Addison.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
N/A

BACKGROUND:
During the June 27 and 28 Strategic Planning retreat, Council discussed a series
of statements and goals that would ultimately be used to formulate this Council’s
vision statement for the Town. That vision statement would serve as the guiding
principal for Council’s future policy discussions and decisions. Based on those
discussions, a draft vision statement was developed for Council review and
discussion at the July 8 work session. 

Modifications were made during the work session on September 15, 2014 and
attached is the draft vision statement for further review.

RECOMMENDATION:

Attachments
Draft Vision Statement



Council’s Vision
To be an attractive, thriving community that delivers the “Addison Way” with superior services, , and a 
safe high quality experience for residents, businesses, visitors and all other stakeholders.  Addison will 
lead the way in creativity, innovation and fiscal responsibility within a culture of excellence, kindness
and an enhanced sense of community.

Council’s Role
The role of the Council is to develop a long-term vision for the Town, to develop policies necessary to 
achieve that vision, and to communicate with, and seek input from, stakeholders.  This includes;

• Providing the direction, trust, and support necessary for the City Manager to implement the 
operational aspects of our vision.

• Making difficult and sometimes unpopular decisions that preserve our unique culture, safeguard 
our assets into the future, and effect the positive change necessary to achieve our goals.

• Identifying future trends, challenges, and opportunities.

• Being a positive and resourceful representative for the Town.

• Promoting transparency in communicating with residents, businesses, and regional partners.

• Being good financial stewards and creating an environment that nurtures a strong, diverse 
business ecosystem

Council’s Goals
Like most cities, Addison is confronted with a number of issues that demand time and attention of 
elected officials and the Town’s management team.  In order to best apply the Town’s limited resources, 
the City Council has established the following goals to guide the organizations efforts. 

• Create raving fans of the “Addison Experience”

• Practice Mindful Stewardship of Town Resources

• Maintain and enhance our unique culture of creativity and innovation.

• Continue to find ways to celebrate our diversity

Council’s Values
The Council will at all times seek to enact policies that will promote, and to personally exemplify, the 
values of the Town of Addison. The Council values;

• Integrity

• Respectfulness

• Fun



• Innovation/ Creativity

• Accountability

• Efficiency

• Kindness

• Openness

“Addison Way”
It is a philosophy that serves as the cornerstone of our service delivery model to our stakeholders.  The 
heart of the “Addison Way” is staff’s charge to find a way to say “yes” to service requests rather than 
responding that they cannot do something. The staff searches out all options to try and meet 
expectations during each customer service interaction.



   
Combined Meeting   R2a           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: N/A

AGENDA CAPTION:
Approval of the Minutes for the September 9, 2014 City Council Meeting and Work
Session.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
N/A

BACKGROUND:
N/A

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

Attachments
09-09-2014 Minutes



D R A F T
OFFICIAL ACTIONS OF THE ADDISON CITY

COUNCIL
WORK SESSION

September 9, 2014
7:30 PM
Addison Town Hall, 5300 Belt Line Rd., Dallas, TX 75254
7:30 PM Regular Meeting
Present: Arfsten; Carpenter; Clemens; DeFrancisco; Heape; Meier; Moore 
 

OFFICIAL ACTIONS OF THE ADDISON CITY
COUNCIL

REGULAR MEETING
 

September 9, 2014
7:30 PM
Addison Town Hall, 5300 Belt Line Rd., Dallas, TX 75254
7:30 PM Regular Agenda
Posted by: Matthew McCombs, September 5, 2014, 5:00pm
 

               

REGULAR MEETING
 

Pledge of Allegiance
 

 Announcements and Acknowledgements regarding Town and
Council Events and Activities

Discussion of Events/Meetings
 

 Consent Agenda.
 

  R2a   Approval of the Minutes for the August 26, 2014 City Council   



  R2a   Approval of the Minutes for the August 26, 2014 City Council
Meeting and Work Session.

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

  

 

  Motion made by DeFrancisco to approve, as submitted,
  Seconded by Clemens  
 

Voting  AYE: Arfsten, Carpenter, Clemens, DeFrancisco, Heape,
Meier, Moore 

Passed 

  R2b   Approval of the Minutes for the September 2, 2014 City Council
Special Meeting and Work Session.

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

  

 

  Motion made by DeFrancisco to approve, as submitted,
  Seconded by Clemens  
 

Voting  AYE: Arfsten, Carpenter, Clemens, DeFrancisco, Heape,
Meier, Moore 

Passed 

 Regular Items
 

  R3   Presentation and proclamation honoring Blood Cancer Awareness
Month.

  

 

  Tiffany Grimes, representative from the Leukemia & Lymphoma
Society, spoke and received the proclamation.

There was no action taken on this item.
 

  R4   Presentation, discussion, consider and take action regarding an
ordinance of the Town of Addison, Texas approving and adopting
the Town’s annual budget for the fiscal year commencing October 1,
2014 and ending September 30, 2015.

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

  

 

  Eric Cannon, Chief Financial Officer, spoke regarding this item.



 

  Motion made by Clemens to approve, as submitted,
  Seconded by Moore  
 

Voting  AYE: Arfsten, Carpenter, Clemens, DeFrancisco, Heape,
Meier, Moore 

Passed 

  R5   Presentation, discussion and consider and take action regarding an
ordinance levying taxes for the Town of Addison, Texas and fixing
and adopting the tax rate for the Town on all taxable property for the
fiscal year beginning October 1, 2014 and ending September 30,
2015; providing for a penalty and interest for delinquent taxes;
declaring an emergency and providing an effective date.

RECOMMENDATION:
It is recommended that the Council approve the property tax rate
ordinance for the 2014-15 fiscal year. This year's proposed tax rate
exceeds the effective tax rate. The vote on the ordinance, resolution,
or order setting the tax rate must be a record vote. Per Dallas
County Tax Assessor, a motion to adopt the ordinance, resolution, or
order must be made in the following form:

“I move that the property tax rate be increased by the adoption of a
tax rate of $0.5618 on each One Hundred Dollars ($100.00) of
assessed valuation, which is effectively a 4.75 percent increase in
the tax rate. Accordingly, I further move adoption of Ordinance No.
014-35 that adopts the tax rate of $0.5618, and move to approve
separately a tax rate of $.3437 that will impose the amount of taxes
needed to fund maintenance and operations expenses for the next
year, and a tax rate of $0.2181 that will be used to pay debt service.”

  

 

  Motion made by DeFrancisco "I move that the property tax rate be
increased by the adoption of a tax rate of $0.5618 on each One
Hundred Dollars ($100.00) of assessed valuation, which is
effectively a 4.75 percent increase in the tax rate. Accordingly, I
further move adoption of Ordinance No. O14-35 that adopts the tax
rate of $0.5618, and move to approve separately a tax rate of
$0.3437 that will impose the amount of taxes needed to fund
maintenance and operations expenses for the next year, and a tax
rate of $0.2181 that will be used to pay debt service."

  Seconded by Carpenter  
 

Voting  AYE: Arfsten, Carpenter, Clemens, DeFrancisco, Heape,



 
Voting  AYE: Arfsten, Carpenter, Clemens, DeFrancisco, Heape,

Meier, Moore 
Passed 

  The vote on the ordinance was a unanimous record vote, each
member of the council voting affirmatively in favor of the ordinance.

 

  R6   Presentation, discussion, consider and take action regarding an
Ordinance ratifying the property tax increase reflected in the Town’s
annual budget for the fiscal year commencing October 1, 2014, and
ending September 30, 2015.

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

  

 

  Motion made by Carpenter to approve, as submitted,
  Seconded by Moore  
 

Voting  AYE: Arfsten, Carpenter, Clemens, DeFrancisco, Heape,
Meier, Moore 

Passed 

  R7   Presentation, discussion, consider and take action approving and
authorizing the City Manager to execute a contract with Teague, Nall
and Perkins to provide engineering design services for the
Revitalization of Midway Road for an amount not to exceed
$1,998,859.

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

  

 

  Lisa Pyles, Director of Infrastructure and Development Services,
spoke regarding this item.

 

  Motion made by DeFrancisco to approve, as submitted,
  Seconded by Heape  
 

Voting  AYE: Arfsten, Carpenter, Clemens, DeFrancisco, Heape,
Meier, Moore 

Passed 

  R8   Presentation, discussion, consider and take action approving and   



  R8   Presentation, discussion, consider and take action approving and
authorizing the City Manager to execute the Third Amendment to
Lease Agreement, by and between the Town and Concourse Plaza
II, Ltd., which is due to expire September 30, 2014, regarding the
lease by the Town, as tenant, of certain premises located within the
Town and generally described as Suite 220, 16051 Addison Road.

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

  

 

  Lisa Pyles, Director of Infrastructure and Development Services,
and Bill Dyer, Airport Real Estate Manager, spoke regarding this
item.

 

  Motion made by Clemens to approve, as submitted,
  Seconded by Moore  
 

Voting  AYE: Arfsten, Carpenter, Clemens, DeFrancisco, Heape,
Meier, Moore 

Passed 

  R9   Presentation and discussion of Belt Line Road Utility
Undergrounding Communication Plan.

  

 

  Lisa Pyles, Director of Infrastructure and Development Services,
and Carrie Rice, Director of Marketing and Communications, spoke
regarding this item.

There was no action taken on this item.
 

  R10   Discussion, consider and take action regarding the Vision Statement
for the Town of Addison.

  

 

  Lea Dunn, City Manager, and Carrie Rice, Director of Marketing
and Communications, spoke regarding this item.

There was no action taken on this item.
 

 Executive Session
 

  ES1   Closed (executive) session of the Addison City Council pursuant to   



  ES1   Closed (executive) session of the Addison City Council pursuant to
Section 551.071, Tex. Gov. Code, to conduct a private consultation
with its attorney(s) on a matter in which the duty of the attorney(s) to
the governmental body under the Texas Disciplinary Rules of
Professional Conduct of the State Bar of Texas clearly conflicts with
Chapter 551, Tex. Gov. Code, pertaining to the ponds or lakes at
Vitruvian Park, located within the vicinity and east of the intersection
of Vitruvian Way and Ponte Ave., and Farmers Branch Creek.

RECOMMENDATION:

  

 

  City Council entered into Executive Session at 9:11 pm.
City Council closed Executive Session at 9:48 pm.

 

 Regular Items Continued
 

  R11   Discussion, consider and take action regarding the ponds or lakes
within the City at Vitruvian Park, located within the vicinity and east
of the intersection of Vitruvian Way and Ponte Ave., and Farmers
Branch Creek.

RECOMMENDATION:

  

 

  There was no action taken on this item.
 

Adjourn Meeting
 

___________________________
Mayor-Todd Meier

Attest:

_______________________________
City Secretary-Matthew McCombs



   
Combined Meeting   R2b           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Brand Protection and Enhancement
Enhance Public Safety

AGENDA CAPTION:
Approval of an Ordinance amending Chapter 38 (Fire Prevention and Protection)
of the Code of Ordinances by amending various sections thereof regarding the
International Fire Code, and adopting the International Fire Code (IFC) 2012
Edition (and certain appendices thereto) and making such other changes and
providing for other provision regarding and relating to the International Fire Code
as set forth in the Ordinance.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
N/A

BACKGROUND:
New code editions are published every three years by the International Code
Council. The codes and local amendments are reviewed by staff and
recommended to Council for adoption.

The 2012 IFC is arranged and organized to follow sequential steps that generally
occur in the plan review and inspection process. The 2012 IFC has been
reorganized into seven parts as illustrated in the attachment, to represent a broad
subject matter and include chapters that logically fit together. The 2012 IFC
includes reserved areas for foreseeable future growth of the Code.

The 2012 IFC and local amendments are recommended for approval by staff to
stay current with industry best practices and to be compatible with our neighboring
cities.

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

Attachments
Fire Code Amendments Ordinance
2012 IFC Changes



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 1 of 3

TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS

ORDINANCE NO. 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS AMENDING 
CHAPTER 38 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN BY 
AMENDING VARIOUS PROVISIONS OF ARTICLE II (FIRE CODE) 
THEREOF, INCLUDING SECTIONS 38-31 (ADOPTION) (AND 
ADOPTING THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, 2012 EDITION, 
INCLUDING APPENDICES B, C, D, E, F, AND G THERETO), 38-32 
(DEFINITIONS), 38-51 (GENERALLY), AND 38-53 (PROVISIONS FOR 
FIRE SAFETY), AND THEREBY PRESCRIBING REGULATIONS 
GOVERNING THE SAFETY OF LIFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE 
AND RELATED CONDITIONS; AMENDING THE SAID 2012
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE AS SET FORTH HEREIN; PROVIDING 
A PENALTY NOT TO EXCEED THE SUM OF $2,000 FOR EACH 
OFFENSE AND A SEPARATE OFFENSE SHALL BE DEEMED 
COMMITTED EACH DAY DURING OR ON WHICH A VIOLATION 
OCCURS OR CONTINUES; PROVIDING FOR INJUNCTIVE RELIEF; 
PROVIDING A SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY 
CLAUSE PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, the amendments set forth in this Ordinance to Chapter 38 of the Code of 
Ordinances of the Town of Addison, Texas (“City”) are pursuant to investigation and analysis by 
the City, and are with a view of and to further the purposes and objectives of, and to promote, the 
health, safety, welfare, convenience and enjoyment of the public, including to protect the public 
welfare, and are to comply with applicable State law; and

WHEREAS, among other things, this Ordinance continues in effect the provisions of 
Section 903.2 of the International Fire Code, 2006 Edition, as amended to read as set forth in 
Section 38-53(i) of the Code of Ordinances of the City, for the purpose of the application, 
interpretation, and/or enforcement of the said Section 903.2 (together with any other provisions 
of the said International Fire Code (including, without limitation, any appendices) that are 
deemed by the Fire Chief of the Town of Addison to be necessary for or useful to the 
application, interpretation, and/or enforcement of the said Section 903.2), and the City Council 
hereby finds that the requirements included in and provisions of the said Section 903.2 and such 
other provisions of the International Fire Code, 2006 Edition have been in effect prior to January 
1, 2009, and that the continuation of those requirements and provisions by this Ordinance is not 
and does not constitute the enactment of an ordinance, bylaw, order, building code, or rule 
requiring the installation of a multipurpose residential fire protection sprinkler system or any 
other fire sprinkler protection system in a new or existing one- or two-family dwelling after 
January 1, 2009; and

WHEREAS, the adoption of this Ordinance and the amendments set forth herein are for 
and in the best interests of the health, safety and welfare of the City and its citizens.



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 2 of 3

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS:

Section 1. Amendments; Repeal.

A. The Code of Ordinances of the Town of Addison, Texas is hereby amended in the 
following particulars, and all other chapters, sections, subsections, paragraphs, sentences, phrases 
and words of the said Code are not amended but are hereby ratified, verified, approved and 
affirmed.

1. Chapter 38 (Fire Prevention and Protection) is amended as set forth in Exhibit A
attached hereto and incorporated herein.

Section 2. Savings.  This Ordinance shall be cumulative of all other ordinances of 
the City affecting fire prevention, protection, and safety and shall not repeal any of the 
provisions of those ordinances except in those instances where the provisions of those ordinances 
are in direct conflict with the provisions of this Ordinance; provided, however, that any 
complaint, liability, action, cause of action, or claim which, prior to the effective date of this 
Ordinance has been initiated or has arisen under or pursuant to any ordinance or portion of the 
Code of Ordinances repealed hereby, shall continue to be governed by the provisions of those 
repealed ordinances or portions of the Code, and for that purposes such ordinances or portions of 
the Code shall be deemed to remain and shall continue in full force and effect.

Section 3. Penalty; Injunctive Relief.  It shall be unlawful for any person to violate 
any provision of this Ordinance, and any person violating or failing to comply with any provision 
hereof shall be fined, upon conviction, in an amount of not more than Two Thousand Dollars 
($2,000.00), and a separate offense shall be deemed committed each day during or on which a 
violation occurs or continues.  In addition to and cumulative to all other penalties, the Town of 
Addison shall have the right to seek injunctive relief for any and all violations of this Ordinance.

Section 4. Severability.  The sections, paragraphs, sentences, phrases, clauses and 
words of this Ordinance are severable, and if any section, paragraph, sentence, phrase, clause or 
word in this Ordinance or application thereof to any person or circumstance is held invalid or 
unconstitutional by a Court of competent jurisdiction, such holding shall not affect the validity of 
the remaining portions of this Ordinance, and the City Council hereby declares that it would have 
passed such remaining portions of this Ordinance despite such invalidity, which remaining 
portions shall remain in full force and effect.

Section 5. Effective Date.  This Ordinance shall become effective from and after its 
date of passage and publication as provided by law.

PASSED AND APPROVED by the City Council of the Town of Addison, Texas this 
_____ day of _________________________, 2014.

Todd Meier, Mayor



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 3 of 3

ATTEST:

By:
Matt McCombs, City Secretary

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

By:
John Hill, City Attorney



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. _______
Page 1 of 5

EXHIBIT A
TO ORDINANCE NO. __________

Chapter 38, Fire Prevention and Protection, of the Code of Ordinances (the “Code”) of 
the Town of Addison, Texas is hereby amended in various sections of Article II (Fire Code) 
thereof as set forth below and as follows (additions are underlined; deletions are struck-through):

1. Section 38-31 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 38-31. Adoption.

There is hereby adopted by the Town of Addison, for the purpose of prescribing 
regulations governing the safety of life and property from fire and related conditions, that 
certain code known as the International Fire Code (for purposes of this Chapter 38, 
"Code"), including appendices B, C, D, E, F, and G thereto, in particular the 20122009
edition thereof, published by the International Code Council, Inc., hereinafter known as 
the "Fire Code" or the "Code", and the whole thereof except for such portions as are 
modified herein, and the same are incorporated as fully as if set out at length herein. 
From the date on which the adoption of the said International Fire Code, 20122009
Edition shall take effect, the provisions thereof and herein shall be controlling within the 
corporate limits of the Town of Addison, Texas.

Notwithstanding the adoption of the 20122009 International Fire Code, Section 
903.2 of the International Fire Code, 2006 Edition ("2006 International Fire Code"), as 
amended by Section 38-53(i) of this Code below, is, together with any other provision of 
the 2006 International Fire Code (including, without limitation, any appendices) that are 
deemed by the Fire Chief of the Town of Addison, or the Fire Chief's designee, to be 
necessary for or useful to the application, interpretation, and/or enforcement of said 
Section 38-53(i), continued in full force and effect for the purpose of the application, 
interpretation, and/or enforcement of the said Section 903.2. For purposes of the said 
Section 38-53(i), references to "the code" and the "Fire Code" means the 2006 
International Fire Code. In the event of any conflict between the provisions of the 2006 
International Fire Code and the provisions of the International Fire Code, 20122009
Edition, the provisions of the 2006 International Fire Code shall control for purposes of 
(and only for purposes of) the application, interpretation, and/or enforcement of the said 
Section 903.2 and any other provisions of the 2006 International Fire Code (including, 
without limitation, any appendices) that are deemed by the Fire Chief, or the Fire Chief’s 
designee, or the Building Official of the Town of Addison to be necessary for or useful to 
the application, interpretation, and/or enforcement of the said Section 903.2.

2. Section 38-51 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 38-51. – Generally.

The 20122009 edition of the International Fire Code is modified by the deletions, 
amendments and modifications provided for in this division.



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. _______
Page 2 of 5

3. Section 38-53 is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 38-53. Provisions for fire safety.

(a) Section 304.1 of the Code shall be amended to read:

Waste Material. Accumulations of any type of waste or scrap material shall not be 
allowed to remain in any location where, in the opinion of the Fire Chief or the 
Fire Chief's designee, they may constitute a fire and life-safety hazard or impede 
fire department operations.

(b) Section 307.1 of the Code shall be amended to read:

General. Open burning, including recreational or ceremonial, fires shall not be 
permitted in the Town of Addison.

Exception: Outdoor cooking is permitted and shall be in accordance with 
Section 308.1.4.

(c) Section 401.5401.3.1 shall be amended to read:

False Alarms and Reports. It shall be unlawful for a person, device or system to 
give, signal or transmit a false fire or medical alarm.

(d) Section 503.1 shall be amended to read:

Where required. Fire lanes and other emergency access routes shall be provided 
in accordance with sections 503.1.1 through 503.1.3 or as approved by the Fire 
Chief or the Fire Chief's designee.

(e) Section 503.2.1 of the code shall be amended to read:

Dimensions. Fire lanes and other emergency access routes shall have an 
unobstructed width of not less than 24-feet and an unobstructed vertical clearance 
of not less than 14-feet. Turning radii, weight capacity, marking and all other 
dimensions or factors affecting fire lanes or emergency access routes shall be as 
specified in the code or as approved by the Fire Chief or the Fire Chief's designee.

(f) Section 901.6.1 of the code shall be amended to read:

Standards. Fire protection systems shall be inspected, tested and maintained in 
accordance with the reference standards listed in Table 901.6.1 or at intervals 
determined by the Fire Chief or the Fire Chief's designee.

(g) Section 901.7 of the code shall be amended to read:



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. _______
Page 3 of 5

Systems out of service. Where a fire protection system is out of service for any 
reason, or in the event of an excessive number of activations, the fire department 
shall be notified immediately and, where required by the Fire Chief or the Fire 
Chief's designee, the building shall be evacuated or an approved fire watch shall 
be provided until the fire protection system has been repaired and returned to 
service.

(h) Section 903.1.1 shall be amended to read:

Alternative protection. Alternative automatic fire extinguishing systems 
complying with Section 904 may be permitted as approved by the Fire Chief or 
the Fire Chief's designee only in addition to automatic fire sprinkler protection. In 
no case shall fire sprinkler protection be removed or omitted based on the 
presence of alternative fire extinguishing systems.

(i) Section 903.2 of the code shall be amended to read:

Where required. An approved automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed as 
follows:

1) In all buildings of any area, size or occupancy built, added to or moved 
into the Town of Addison after December 8, 1992. In the case of an 
addition to an existing structure or space an approved automatic fire 
sprinkler system shall be installed in the addition and the existing structure 
or space.

Unless otherwise required in the code, the following exceptions apply:

Exception 1: Detached Group U occupancies that do not exceed 500 
square feet in area and are located six feet from any other building.

Exception 2: Open parking garages of noncombustible construction that 
have no other types of occupancies located above the garage.

Exception 3: Existing, unsprinklered, single-family detached dwellings 
which are added to for the purpose of increasing livable area.

Exception 4: Covered walkways or open canopies above fuel dispensing 
pumps, bus stops or other similar structures intended only for the 
temporary protection of persons from inclement weather but not including 
covered patios attached to buildings.

Exception 5: Group S-12 occupancies used only for the storage or parking 
of aircraft. (NOTE: All aircraft hangars are subject to the provisions of 
NFPA 409.)



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. _______
Page 4 of 5

2) In any existing building of any size, area or occupancy (except single-
family detached residences), remodeled or reconstructed after the effective 
date of this ordinance, where greater than 50% of either the square footage 
or the (DCAD assessed) dollar value is involved.

3) In the attic of any building required by this section to have a fire sprinkler 
system.

Exception: the attics of single-family dwellings on fee simple lots.

4) In the occupancies and locations set forth in section 903 of the Fire Code.

(j) Section 903.3.1.1 shall be amended to read:

NFPA-13 sprinkler systems. Where the provisions of this ordinance require that a 
building or portion thereof be equipped with an automatic fire sprinkler system, 
sprinklers shall be installed in accordance with the appropriate version of NFPA-
13 with any such additions or modifications as may be required by the Fire Chief 
or the Fire Chief's designee.

(k) Section 903.4 of the Code shall be amended to read:

Sprinkler system monitoring and alarms. All valves controlling the water supply 
and all water flow alarm switches on fire sprinkler systems shall be electronically 
supervised and monitored by an approved fire alarm monitoring agency, 
regardless of the number of sprinkler heads served.

Exception. Fire sprinkler valve and alarm monitoring for single-family 
dwellings on fee simple lots shall be at the discretion of the property 
owner.

(l) Section 905.1 of the Code shall be amended to read:

Generally. Standpipe systems shall be provided as set forth in this section or as 
required by the prevention chief.

(m) Section 56083301.1 of the Code shall be amended to read:

Scope. The manufacture, possession, storage, sale, transportation, use, handling 
and/or presence of explosive materials of any type is prohibited in the Town of
Addison except as noted below:

Exception 1. Explosive materials used by the armed forces of the United 
States or other governmental agencies acting in an official capacity.

Exception 2. The possession, use and storage of small arms ammunition in 
accordance with section 56063306 of the Code.



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. _______
Page 5 of 5

Exception 3. Approved construction or demolition projects for which a 
permit has been obtained and where all necessary safety precautions are 
reviewed by the fire department and observed on site.

(n) Section 3308.1 of the Code is hereby amended to read:

Generally. The manufacture, possession, storage, sale, transportation, use, 
handling and/or presence of fireworks or pyrotechnic material of any type is 
prohibited in the Town of Addison except as noted below:

Exceptions.

1) Approved events organized and conducted by licensed fireworks 
and pyrotechnic professionals where all necessary safety 
precautions are reviewed by the fire department and observed on 
site.

2) Any composition or device that produces a visible or audible effect 
for entertainment purposes and that produces negligible heat or 
flame and is not activated by contact with a flame or heat 
producing device.

(o) Section 57043404 of the Code shall be amended by the addition of:

5704.13404.1 Location. Facilities storing or handling hazardous, flammable or 
combustible liquids or materials in excess of the quantities listed in Table 
5003.1.12703.1.1, may only be located as approved by the Fire Chief or the Fire 
Chief's designee.

(p) Section 5703.4.83404.3.8 of the Code is hereby amended to read:

Liquid storage warehouses. The storage of flammable liquids in the manner 
defined by the Code as a "liquid storage warehouse" is prohibited in the Town of 
Addison.









   
Combined Meeting   R2c           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Brand Protection and Enhancement
Enhance Public Safety

AGENDA CAPTION:
Approval of Ordinances amending Chapter 18 (Buildings and Building
Regulations) of the Code of Ordinances by amending various sections thereof
regarding:

The International Building Code, and adopting the International Building
Code, 2012 Edition (and certain appendices thereto) and making other
changes to the International Building Code as set forth in the Ordinance.

1.

The International Residential Code, and adopting the International Residential
Code, 2012 Edition (and certain appendices thereto) and making other
changes to the International Residential Code as set forth in the Ordinance.

2.

The International Energy Conservation Code, and adopting the International
Energy Conservation Code, 2012 Edition and making other changes to the
International Energy Conservation Code as set forth in the Ordinance.

3.

The International Property Maintenance Code, and adopting the International
Property Maintenance Code, 2012 Edition and making other changes to the
International Property Maintenance Code as set forth in the Ordinance.

4.

The Electrical Code, and the National Electrical Code, and adopting the
National Electrical Code, 2014 Edition and making other changes to the
Electrical Code and National Electrical Code as set forth in the Ordinance.

5.

The International Plumbing Code, and adopting the International Plumbing
Code, 2012 Edition and making other changes to the International Plumbing
Code as set forth in the Ordinance.

6.

The International Mechanical Code, and adopting the International
Mechanical Code, 2012 Edition and making other changes to the
International Mechanical Code as set forth in the Ordinance.

7.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
N/A

BACKGROUND:
The Town is currently operating under the 2008 and 2009 codes. New code



The Town is currently operating under the 2008 and 2009 codes. New code
editions are published every three years. The codes are then submitted to the
Council with amendments recommended by the staff and NCTCOG for adoption.
Addison’s approach has always been to wait couple years before adopting new
codes to observe how they have been applied in other locations and identify
potential areas that may need to be adjusted before the Town adopts them.

These codes are recommended for adoption by the staff to keep abreast of State
law and to be compatible with our neighboring cites. The proposed language
makes various adjustments to the Code which is mostly administrative in nature to
reflect the revised code edition and account for the renumbering of code sections.

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

Attachments
2012 IBC MEMO
2012 IBC ORD
2012 IRC MEMO
2012 IRC ORD
2012 IPMC MEMO
2012 IPMC ORD
2014 NEC MEMO
2014 NEC ORD
2012 IPC MEMO
2012 IPC ORD
2012 IMC MEMO
2012 IMC ORD



To: Charles Goff , Assistant Director Development Services and Planning

From: Lynn Chandler, Building Official

Date: September 8, 2014

Subject: 2012 IBC 

The following changes were made to the Code of Ordinance:

Sec. 18-31. Adopted. Changed text to read 2012 codes.

Sec. 18-57. Separation and Sec. 1-58 Table 602. These amendments were deleted because 
staff feels the base code is sufficient to accommodate the required separation.  

Sec. 18-56. Atrium. Changed text to read section 202.  

Sec. 18-62 Alternative protection. Change recommended by the Fire Department.

Sec. 18-63. Automatic fire-extinguishing system. Changed text to delete S-2 occupancies 
to conform to new code.

Sec. 18-63.1 NFPA 13 Sprinkler systems. Changed recommended by the Fire 
Department.

Sec. 18-63.1.1 Group A-2. This amendment was deleted to correspond with the Fire 
Code ordinance and base text of the new code.

Sec. 63.5 High rise buildings. This amendment is no longer needed because the definition 
of a high rise building is covered in Section 202 of the building code.

Sec. 66.6 Accessible means of egress. Amendment recommended by NCTCOG.   

Sec. 18-67. Corridor construction. Changed text to correspond to new building code..

Sec. 18-67.1. Smokeproof enclosures. Changed text to read section 403.5.4.



Sec. 18-67.2 Luminous egress path markings. Amendment is no longer needed because 
the definition of a high rise building is covered in Section 202 of the building code.

Sec. 18-67.3. Emergency escape and rescue. Amendment recommended by NCTCOG.

Sec. 18-74 Disposal of construction waste. Changed text to read Section 3314.

Sec. 18-75. Excavation, construction or demolition. Changed text to read 3315.

Sec. 18-76. Storm water runoff. Changed text to read 3316.

Sec. 18-79. Amendments to the International Energy Conservation Code. Amendment 
recommended by NCTCOG to satisfy the “not less restrictive” requirement when 
adopting subsequent editions of energy codes in accordance with Texas SB 5, 77th

Legislature.



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 1 of 3

TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS

ORDINANCE NO. _________

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS AMENDING 
CHAPTER 18 (BUILDING AND BUILDING REGULATIONS) OF THE 
CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN BY AMENDING VARIOUS 
PROVISIONS OF ARTICLE I (IN GENERAL) AND ARTICLE II 
(BUILDING CODE) THEREOF, INCLUDING: SECTIONS 18-31 
(ADOPTED) (AND ADOPTING THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 
AND THE INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE, 2012 
EDITION, INCLUDING CERTAIN APPENDICES THERETO), 18-56 
(ATRIUM); 18-62 (ALTERNATIVE PROTECTION); 18-63 (AUTOMATIC 
FIRE-EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS); 18-63.1 (NFPA-13 SPRINKLER 
SYSTEMS); 18-67 CORRIDOR CONSTRUCTION; 18-67.1 (SMOKEPROOF 
ENCLOSURES AND PRESSURIZED STAIRWAYS); 18-74 (DISPOSAL OF 
CONSTRUCTION WASTE); 18-75 (EXCAVATION, CONSTRUCTION OR 
DEMOLITION AT NIGHT PROHIBITED); 18-76 (STORMWATER
RUNOFF); AND 18-79 (AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL 
ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE); AND ADDING TO THE CODE OF 
ORDINANCES SECTION 18-67.3 (EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE) 
AND SECTION 18-66 (ACCESSIBLE MEANS OF EGRESS); AND 
DELETING IN THEIR ENTIRETY FROM THE CODE OF ORDINANCES 
SECTIONS 18-57 (SEPARATION), 18-58 (TABLE 602); 18-63.1.1 (GROUP A-
2), 18-63.5 (HIGH-RISE BUILDINGS), AND 18-67.2 (LUMINOUS EGRESS
PATH MARKINGS); PROVIDING A SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING A 
PENALTY NOT TO EXCEED THE SUM OF FIVE HUNDRED DOLLARS
($500.00)  FOR EACH OFFENSE, AND A SEPARATE OFFENSE SHALL BE 
DEEMED COMMITTED EACH DAY DURING OR ON WHICH A 
VIOLATION OCCURS OR CONTINUES; PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY 
CLAUSE; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS,  the amendments set forth in this Ordinance to Chapter 18 are pursuant to 
investigation and analysis by the City, and are with a view of and to further the purposes and 
objectives set forth in Section 18-31 of the Code, including to promote the health, safety, 
welfare, convenience and enjoyment of the public, including to protect the public welfare, and 
are to comply with applicable State law; and 

WHEREAS, among other things, this Ordinance continues in effect the provisions of 
chapter 9 of the International Building Code, 2006 Edition for the purposes of the application, 
interpretation, and/or enforcement of Section 18-429 of the Code of Ordinances (together with 
any other provisions of the International Building Code (including, without limitation, any 
appendices) that are deemed by the Building Official of the Town of Addison to be necessary for 
or useful to the application, interpretation, and/or enforcement of the said Section 18-429), and 
the City Council hereby finds that the requirements included in and provisions of the said chapter 
9 and other provisions of the International Building Code, 2006 Edition have been in effect prior 
to January 1, 2009, and that the continuation of those requirements and provisions by this 



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 2 of 3

Ordinance is not and does not constitute the enactment of an ordinance, bylaw, order, building 
code, or rule requiring the installation of a multipurpose residential fire protection sprinkler 
system or any other fire sprinkler protection system in a new or existing one- or two-family 
dwelling after January 1, 2009; and  

WHEREAS, the adoption of this Ordinance and the amendments set forth herein are for 
and in the best interests of the health, safety and welfare of the City and its citizens.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS:

Section 1. Incorporation of Recitals.  The above and foregoing recitals and premises 
to this Ordinance are true and correct and are incorporated herein and made a part hereof for all 
purposes.

Section 2. Amendment.  The Code of Ordinances of the Town of Addison, Texas 
(the “City”) is hereby amended by amending certain sections and provisions of Chapter 18 
(Building and Building Regulations), Article II (Building Code) thereof as set forth in Exhibit A 
attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes, and all other chapters, articles, sections, 
subsections, sentences, phrases and words of the said Code of Ordinances are not amended 
hereby.

Section 3. Savings; Repealer.  This Ordinance shall be cumulative of all other 
ordinances of the City and shall not repeal any of the provisions of those ordinances except in 
those instances where the provisions of those ordinances are in direct conflict with the provisions 
of this Ordinance.  Provided, however, that the repeal of such ordinances or parts of such 
ordinances, and the amendments and changes made by this Ordinance, shall not affect any right, 
property or claim which was or is vested in the City, or any act done, or right accruing or 
accrued, or established, or any suit, action or proceeding had or commenced before the time 
when this Ordinance shall take effect; nor shall said repeals, amendments or changes affect any 
offense committed, or any penalty or forfeiture incurred, or any suit or prosecution pending at 
the time when this Ordinance shall take effect under any of the ordinances or sections thereof so 
repealed, amended or changed; and to that extent and for that purpose the provisions of such 
ordinances or parts of such ordinances shall be deemed to remain and continue in full force and 
effect.

Section 4. Penalty.  It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, corporation, or other 
business entity to violate any provision of this Ordinance, and any person, firm, corporation, or 
other business entity violating or failing to comply with any provision hereof shall be fined, upon 
conviction, in an amount of not more than Five Hundred and No/100 Dollars ($500.00), and a 
separate offense shall be deemed committed each day during or on which a violation or failure 
occurs or continues.

Section 5. Severability.  The provisions of this Ordinance are severable, and if any 
section or provision of this Ordinance or the application of any section or provision to any 
person, firm, corporation, entity, situation or circumstance is for any reason adjudged invalid or 
held unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, the same shall not affect the validity 



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 3 of 3

of any other section or provision of this Ordinance or the application of any other section or 
provision to any other person, firm, corporation, entity, situation or circumstance, and the City 
Council declares that it would have adopted the valid portions of this Ordinance adopted herein 
without the invalid or unconstitutional parts and to this end the provisions of this Ordinance 
adopted herein shall remain in full force and effect.

Section 6. Effective Date.  This Ordinance shall become effective from and after its 
passage and approval and its publication as may be required by law (including, without 
limitation, the City Charter and the ordinances of the City).

PASSED AND APPROVED by the City Council of the Town of Addison, Texas this
___ day of ____________, 2014.

Todd Meier, Mayor
ATTEST:

By:
Matt McCombs, City Secretary

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

By:
John Hill, City Attorney



EXHIBIT A TO ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 1 of 11

EXHIBIT A
TO ORDINANCE NO. __________

Chapter 18, Buildings and Building Regulations, of the Code of Ordinances (the “Code”)of the 
Town of Addison, Texas is hereby amended in various sections of Article I (In General) and 
Article II (Building Code) thereof as set forth below and follows (additions are underlined; 
deletions are struck-through):

1. Section 18-31 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-31. Adopted.

For the purpose of providing minimum standards to safeguard life or limb, health, 
property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction, 
quality of materials used, use and occupancy, location and maintenance of all buildings 
and structures within the city and certain equipment specifically regulated herein, the 
International Building Code, 20122009 Edition, the and the International Energy 
Conservation Code, 20122009 Edition, (copies of which, authenticated by the signature 
of the mayor and the city secretary, and made a public record by ordinance, is on file in 
the city secretary’s office), are hereby adopted as the building code of the city as fully as 
if copied at length in this article, but with the changes therein and additions thereto to 
provided in this article.  Also, adopted are Appendices E, F, G, I and J of the 20092006
Edition of the International Building Code.

Notwithstanding the adoption of the 20122009 International Building Code, 
chapter 9 of the International Building Code, 2006 Edition (“2006 International Building 
Code”) is continued in full force and effect for the purpose of the application, 
interpretation, and/or enforcement of Section 18-429 of this Chapter, together with any 
other provisions of the 2006 International Building Code (including, without limitation, 
any appendices) that are deemed by the Building Official of the Town of Addison to be 
necessary for or useful to the application, interpretation, and/or enforcement of the said 
Section 18-429.  For purposes of the said Section 18-429, the reference to chapter 9 of the 
International Building Code means chapter 9 of the 2006 International Building Code.  In 
the event of any conflict between the provisions of the 2006 International Building Code 
and the provisions of the International Residential Code, 2012 2009 Edition, the 
provisions of the 2006 International Building Code shall control for purposes of (and 
only for purposes of) the application, interpretation, and/or enforcement of Section 18-
429 of this Chapter and any other provisions of the 2006 International Building Code 
(including, without limitation, any appendices) that are deemed by the Building Official 
of the Town of Addison to be necessary for or useful to the application, interpretation, 
and/or enforcement of the said Section 18-429.

2. Section 18-56 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

18-56. Atrium.

The International Building Code is amended by changing the definition of an atrium in 



EXHIBIT A TO ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 2 of 11

Section 202 second paragraph of subsection 404.1.1 to read as follows:

ATRIUM. An opening connecting three or more stories other than enclosed stairways, 
elevators, hoistways, escalators, plumbing, electrical, air-conditioning or other 
equipment, which is enclosed at the top and not defined as a mall. Stories, as used in this 
definition, do not include balconies within assembly groups or mezzanines that comply 
with Section 505.

3. Section 18-57 of the Code of Ordinances is deleted in its entirety:

Sec. 18-57.  Separation.

The International Building Code is amended by adding item 4.to subsection 406.1.2 as 
follows:

   4. A separation is not required between a Group R-2 and U carport provided that the 
carport is open on all sides and that the distance between the two is at least 10 feet ( 3048 
mm).

4. Section 18-58 of the Code of Ordinances is deleted in its entirety:

Sec. 18-58. Table 602.

The International Building code is amended by changing footnote b in Table 602 to read 
as follows:

   b. For special requirements for Group U see section 406.1.2. Group R-3 and Group U 
when used as accessory to Group R-3, as applicable in 101.2 shall not be required to have 
a fire-resistive rating where fire separation distance is three feet or more. Group R-2 and 
Group U carport, as applicable in 406.1.4 exception 4 shall not be required to have a fire 
resistance rating where the fire separation is ten feet or more.   

5. Section 18-62 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-62. Alternative protection.

The International Building Code is amended by changing 903.1.1 to read as follows:

903.1.1 Alternative protection: Alternative automatic fire-extinguishing systems 
complying with Section 904 may be permitted as approved by the Fire Prevention
Chief or the Fire Chief’s designee only in addition to automatic fire sprinkler 
protection. In no case shall fire sprinkler protection be removed or omitted based 
on the presence of alternative-extinguishing systems.

6. Sec. 18-63 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-63. Automatic fire-extinguishing systems.



EXHIBIT A TO ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 3 of 11

The International Building Code is amended by changing subsection 903.2 to read as 
follows:

903.2 Sprinklers required. An approved automatic fire sprinkler system shall be 
installed as follows:

(1) In all buildings of any area, size or occupancy built added to or moved 
into the Town of Addison after December 8, 1992.  In the case of an 
addition to an existing structure or space an approved automatic fire 
sprinkler system shall be installed in the addition and the existing structure 
or space.  Unless otherwise required in the code, the following exceptions 
apply:

Exception 1: Detached Group U occupancies that do not exceed 500 
square feet in area and are located six feet from any other building.

Exception 2: Open parking garages of noncombustible construction that 
have no other types of occupancies located above the garage.

Exception 3: Existing, unsprinklered, single family detached dwellings 
which are added to for the purpose of increasing livable area.

Exception 4: Covered walkways or open canopies above fuel dispensing 
pumps, bus stops or other similar structures intended only for the 
temporary protection of persons from inclement weather but not including 
covered patios attached to buildings.

Exception 5: Group S-1S-2 occupancies used only for the storage or 
parking of aircraft.  (NOTE:  Aircraft hangars are subject to the provisions 
of NFPA 409.)

(2) In any existing building of any size, area or occupancy, remodeled or 
reconstructed after the effective date of this ordinance where the remodel 
or reconstruction involves greater than 50 % of the square footage of the 
structure or costs in excess of 50 % of the dollar value of the structure as 
assessed by the Dallas Central Appraisal District.

(3) In the attic of any building REQUIRED to have a fire sprinkler 
system.  Exception: Attics of single family residences on fee simple lots.

(4) In the occupancies and location as set forth in this section.

For provisions on special hazards and hazardous materials, see the fire code.

7. Sec. 18-63.1 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-63.1  NFPA 13 Sprinkler systems.



EXHIBIT A TO ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 4 of 11

The International Building Code is amended by changing subsection 903.3.1.1 to  read as 
follows:

903.3.1.1 NFPA-13 sprinkler systems.  Where the provisions of this ordinance 
require that a building or portion thereof be equipped with an automatic fire 
sprinkler system, sprinklers shall be installed in accordance with the appropriate 
version of NFPA-13 with any such additions or modifications as may be required 
by the Fire Prevention Chief or the Fire Chief’s designee.

8. Section18-63.1.1, Group A-2, of the Code of Ordinances is deleted in its entirety:

Sec. 18-63.1.1. Group A-2.

The International Building Code is amended by changing section 903.2.1.2 1. to read as 
follows:

1. The fire area exceeds 1500 square feet.

9. Section 18-63.5, High-rise buildings, of the Code of Ordinances is deleted in its entirety:

Sec. 18-63.5 High-rise buildings.

         The International building code is amended by changing 75 feet to read 55 feet and 
22 860 mm to read 16 764 mm in section 907.2.13.

  

10. The Code of Ordinances is amended by adding Section 18-66 Accessible Means of 
Egress to read as follows:

Sec. 16-66 Accessible Means of Egress.

The International Building Code is amended by adding Exception 4. To Section 1007.1 to 
read as follows:

4.   Buildings regulated under State Law and built in accordance with State 
registered plans, including any variances or waivers granted by the State, shall be 
deemed to be in compliance with the requirements of Section 1007.

11. The Code of Ordinances is amended by changing Section 18-67 Corridor Construction to 
read as follows:

Sec. 18-67. Corridor Construction.

The International Building Code is amended by adding exception 65 to subsection 1018.1
to read as follows:



EXHIBIT A TO ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 5 of 11

65. Nonrated construction within a single tenant space in the following 
circumstances:

(i) Smoke detectors are installed along the path of travel per 
manufacturer’s instructions, but in no case more than sixty (60) 
feet.

(ii) The actuation of the smoke detectors provides an alarm audible 
within the space.

(iii) The smoke alarms are connected to the building’s fire alarm 
system where a system is provided.

12. The Code of Ordinances is amended by changing Section 18-67.1. to read as follows:

Sec. 18-67.1. Smokeproof enclosures and pressurized stairways.

The International Building Code is amended by changing 75 feet to read 55 feet 
and 22,860 mm to read 16,674 mm in section 403.5.41022.9.

13. Section 18-67.2, Luminous egress path markings, of the Code of Ordinances is deleted in 
its entirety:

Sec.18-67.2 Luminous egress path markings.

The International Building Code is amended by changing 75 feet to read 55 feet and 
22,860 mm to read 16,674 mm in section 1024.1.

14. The Code of Ordinances is amended by adding Section 18-67.3 to read as follows;

Sec. 18-67.3. Emergency escape and rescue.

The International Building Code is amended by changing Section 1029.1 General in part 
to read as follows:

1029.1 General. In addition to the means of egress required by this chapter, 
provisions shall be made for emergency escape and rescue openings in Group R 
and I-1 occupancies. {Remainder of paragraph unchanged}

Exceptions: {Exceptions 1 through 3 unchanged; a new Exception 4 is added to 
Section 1039.1 to read as follows:}

4. In other than Group R-3 occupancies, buildings equipped throughout with 
an approved automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 
903.3.1.2.

15. The Code of Ordinances is amended by changing Section 18-74 to read as follows:



EXHIBIT A TO ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 6 of 11

Sec. 18-74. Disposal of construction waste.

The International Building Code is amended by adding Section 33143313 to read as 
follows:

Section 33143313. Disposal of construction waste.

3314.13313.. General requirements.

(1) Each holder of permit under this code shall be required to provide a refuse 
container for disposal of waste and rubbish upon construction sites.  The size of 
such container shall be approved by the building official and shall be sufficiently 
large to hold the rubbish and waste in such manner that it will not blow out or 
spill over.  The location of such refuse container shall be approved by the building 
official.

(2) If the proposed improvement for which the permit has been issued is less than five 
thousand dollar ($5,000.00), the building official may, in his sole discretion, 
waive the requirement of a refuse container if he deems it not necessary and other 
means of disposal have been approved by him.

(3) In this section:

a. Waste means garbage and other decayable, nondecayable, used up, 
broken, rejected or worthless materials.

b. Rubbish means trash, debris, rubble, stone, useless fragments of building 
materials and other miscellaneous useless wastes or rejected matter.

c. Public right-of-way means the entire width between property lines of road, 
streets, ways, thoroughfares, bridges or parks in this city, not privately 
owned or controlled, if any part of the road, street, way, thoroughfare, 
bridge or park is opened to the public for vehicular traffic.

(4) Upon determination by the building official that a permit holder has failed to 
maintain or use an approved refuse container, in violation of the provisions of this 
ordinance, an order to correct the offending condition will be issued to the permit 
holder.  Such order shall be telephoned to the permit holder and confirmed by 
mailing a copy of the order by certified mail, return receipt requested.  The order 
shall specifically describe the offending condition and suggest actions necessary 
to correct the condition.  Failure to properly correct the offending condition 
within three (3) days (excluding Saturdays, Sundays, and legal holidays) after the 
mailing date of the order shall subject the permit holder to the issuance of a 
citation.

(5) In addition to the enforcement procedures provided in this ordinance, it shall be 
within the power and discretion of the building official to suspend or revoke the 
permit for violation of any provision of this ordinance.  Suspension or revocation 



EXHIBIT A TO ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 7 of 11

shall be mandatory for the third offense under this ordinance.

16. Section 18-75 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-75.  Excavation, construction or demolition at night prohibited.

The International Building Code is amended by adding Section 33153314 to read as 
follows:

Section 33153314. Excavation, construction or demolition at night prohibited.

3315.13314.1. General requirements.

(1) Intent and purpose. The City Council of the Town of Addison finds and declares 
that:

(a) The uncontrolled excavation, erection, construction or demolition at night 
upon buildings or structures presents an inconvenience or danger to the 
welfare and safety of those persons residing within or near the buildings or 
structures worked upon.

(b) Such nocturnal activity causes inconvenience or danger to those persons 
residing within or near the buildings or structures worked upon so as to 
constitute a public nuisance.

(c) It is a matter of public necessity that the Town of Addison protect those 
persons residing within or near the buildings or structures worked upon 
from the danger posed by such nocturnal activity.

(d) The provisions and prohibitions hereinafter contained and enacted are in 
pursuance of and for the morals and general welfare of persons in the 
Town of Addison.

(e) There is an immediate and present danger presented by the above 
described uncontrolled nocturnal activity, creating an emergency.

(2) Unlawful activity. It shall be unlawful for a person, firm or corporation to 
excavate, erect, build, construct, alter, repair or demolish any building or structure which 
has been issued or which is required to be issued a building permit by the Town of 
Addison between the hours of 7:00 P.M. and 7:00 A.M. Monday through Friday, and 
between the hours of 7:00 P.M. and 8:00 A.M. on Saturday and Sunday, if such activity 
is performed within a residential, apartment or townhouse zoned area, or within three 
hundred (300) feet of an occupied residence, except in cases of urgent necessity or in the 
interest of public safety and convenience, and then only by permission of the city 
manager.

(3) Exception. The provisions of this section shall not apply to the city and utility 
companies when engaged in the installation or repair of utility lines situated within such 



EXHIBIT A TO ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 8 of 11

buildings or structures.

(4) Posting of sign. The owner of the property upon which activity is carried on or the 
general contractor shall be responsible for the posting of a sign in a clearly visible area at 
all entrances to construction sites that will state the hours during which construction is 
allowed.

17. Section 18-76 of the Code is amended to read as follows;

Sec. 18-76. Storm water runoff.

The International Building Code is amended by adding Section 33163315 to read as 
follows:

Section 33163315. Storm water runoff.

3316.13315.1. General requirements.  It shall be unlawful for any person on any 
construction site to allow excessive storm water runoff to be discharged directly into any 
public street, alley or private street so as to create a nuisance.  Should surface runoff be 
declared a nuisance by the city, the owner, builder and/or developer of the site may be 
required to construct dikes or dams on site to form detention areas such that storm water 
may be temporarily detained until such storm abates at which point the trapped water 
may be slowly released.  It shall be the responsibility of the owner, builder and/or 
developer at a construction site to remove any dirt or mud deposit on adjacent public 
streets, alleys or private streets as a result of storm water runoff.

18. Section 18-79 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec.18-79. Amendments to the International Energy Conservation Code.

The International Energy Conservation Code is amended to read as follows:

Section C101.4.2 and R101.4.2; change to read as follows:

C101.4.2/R101.4.2 Historic Buildings.  Any building or structure that is listed in 
the State or National Register of Historic Places; designated as a historic property 
under local or state designation law or survey; certified as a contributing resource 
with a National Register listed or locally designated historic district; or with an 
opinion or certification that the property is eligible to be listed on the National or 
State Registers of Historic Places either individually or as a contributing building 
to a historic district by the State Historic Preservation Officer of the Keeper of the 
National Register of Historic Places, shall comply with all of the provisions of 
this code.

Exception:  Whenever a provision or provisions shall invalidate or 
jeopardize the historical designation or listing, that provision or provisions 
may be exempted.



EXHIBIT A TO ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 9 of 11

Section C102/R102; add Section C102.1.2 and R102.1.2 to read as follows:

C102.1.2/R102.1.2 Alternative compliance.  A building certified by a national, 
state, or local accredited energy efficiency program and determined by the Energy 
Systems Laboratory to be in compliance with the energy efficiency requirements 
of this section may, at the option of the Code Official, be considered in 
compliance.  The United States Environmental Protection Agency's Energy Star 
Program certification of energy code equivalency shall be considered in 
compliance.

Section C202 and R202; add the following definition:

GLAZING AREA.  Total area of the glazed fenestration measured using the 
rough opening and including sash, curbing or other framing elements that enclose 
conditioned space. Glazing area includes the area of glazed fenestration 
assemblies in walls bounding conditioned basements.  For doors where the 
daylight opening area is less that 50 percent of the door area, the glazing area is 
the daylight opening area.  For all other doors, the glazing area is the rough 
opening area for the door including the door and the frame.

Section R402.2.2; amend the section to read as follows:

R402.2.2 Ceilings without attic spaces. Where Section R402.1.1 would require 
insulation levels above R-30 and the design of the roof/ceiling assembly does not 
allow sufficient space for the required insulation, the minimum required 
insulation for such roof/ceiling assemblies shall be R-30. This reduction of 
insulation from the requirements of Section R402.1.1 shall be limited to 500 
square feet (46 m2). This reduction shall not apply to the U -factor alternative 
approach in Section R402.1.3 and the total UA alternative in Section R402.1.4.

R402.4.1.2 Testing; Add a last paragraph to read as follows:

Testing may only be performed by individuals that are certified HERS Raters or 
Rating Field Inspectors by RESNET or Performance Verification Technicians 
certified by Texas HERO, or other certifications as may be approved by the 
building official. The certified individuals must be an independent third-party 
entity, and may not be employed; or have any financial interest in the company 
that constructs the structure.

R403.2.2 Sealing (Mandatory); Add a last paragraph to read as follows:

Testing may only be performed by individuals that are certified HERS Raters or 
Rating Field Inspectors by RESNET or Performance Verification Technicians 
certified by Texas HERO, or other certifications as may be approved by the 
building official. The certified individuals must be an independent third-party 
entity, and may not be employed; or have any financial interest in the company 
that installed the duct system.



EXHIBIT A TO ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 10 of 11

Section R403.2.3; Amend to read as follows:

R403.2.3 Building cavities (Mandatory). Building framing cavities shall not be 
used as supply ducts. Building framing wall cavities in the exterior thermal 
envelope shall not be used as return ducts.

Section C402.2.9/R402.2; Add Section C402.2.9 and R402.2.13 to read as follows:

Section C402.2.9/R402.2 Insulation installed in walls.  To insure that insulation 
remains in place, insulation batts installed in walls shall be totally secured by an 
enclosure on all sides consisting of framing lumber, gypsum, sheathing, wood 
structural panel sheathing, netting or other equivalent material approved by the 
building official.

R405.6.2; add the following sentence to the end of paragraph:

Acceptable performance software simulation tools may include, but are not 
limited to, REM RateTM, Energy Gauge and IC3. Other performance software 
programs accredited by RESNET BESTEST and having the ability to provide a 
report as outlined in R405.4.2 may also be deemed acceptable performance 
simulation programs and may be considered by the building official.

Amend Section 101.4.2 Historic Buildings to read as follows:

101.4.2 Historic Buildings. Any building or structure that is listed in the State or National 
Register of Historic Places; designated as a historic property under local or state 
designation law or survey; certified as a contributing resource with a National Register 
listed or locally designated historic district; or with an opinion or certification that the 
property is eligible to be listed on the National or State Registers of Historic Places either 
individually or as a contributing building to a historic district by the State Historic 
Preservation Officer of the Keeper of the National Register of Historic Places, shall 
comply with all the provisions of this code.

Exception: Whenever a provision or provisions shall invalidate or jeopardize the 
historical designation or listing, that provision or provisions may be exempted.

Amend Section 103.1.1 Above code programs to read as follows:

103.1.1 Alternative compliance. A building certified by a national, state, or local 
accredited energy efficiency program determined by the Energy Systems Laboratory to 
be in compliance with the energy efficiency requirements of this section may, at the 
option of the Code Official, be considered in compliance. The United States 
Environmental Protection Agency’s Energy Star Program certification of energy code 
equivalency shall be considered in compliance.

Amend SECTION 202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS by adding the following definition:



EXHIBIT A TO ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 11 of 11

GLAZING AREA. Total  area of the glazed fenestration measured using the rough 
opening and including sash, curbing or other framing elements that enclose the 
conditioned space. Glazing area includes the area of the glazed fenestration assemblies in 
walls bounding conditioned basements. For doors where daylight opening is less than 50 
percent of the door area, that glazing area is the daylight opening area. For all other 
doors, the glazing area is the rough opening area for the door including the door and the 
frame.

Amend Section 401.2 Compliance, Item #1 to read as follows:
1.Sections 402.1 through 402.3, 403.2.1 and 404.1 (prescriptive) and the use of Tables 
402.1.1 and 402.1.3 are limited to a maximum glazing area of 15% window area to floor 
area or ratio; or

Amend Section 402 by adding Section 402.2.12 to read as follows:

402.2.12 Insulation installed in walls. Insulation installed in walls shall be totally 
surrounded by an enclosure on all sides consisting of framing lumber, gypsum, sheathing, 
wood structural panel sheathing or other equivalent material approved by the building 
official.

Amend Section 405.4.1 by adding a sentence to the end of the paragraph to read as 
follows:

RemRateTM, Energy GaugeTM, and IC3 are deemed acceptable performance programs.



To: Charles Goff, Director Development Services and Planning

From: Lynn Chandler, Building Official

Date: September 8, 2014

Subject: 2012 IRC

The following changes were made to the 2012 IRC ordinance:

Sec. 18-401. Adopted. Text changed to read 2012 IRC.

Sections 18-421, 18-422, 18-423, 18-424, 18-425,18-426, 18-427, 18-428, 18-430, 18-
431, 18-432, 18-433, 18-434, 18-435, 18-436, 18-436.1, 18-436.2, 18-437, 18-438,18-
439, 18-441 are amended to read 2012.

Sec. 18-431, Excavation, Construction and Demolition at night prohibited. Section 3314 
changed to read 3315 because section numbers changed in 2012 IBC.

Sec. 18-432. Storm Runoff. Section 3315 changed to read 3316 because numbers 
changed in 2012 IBC.

Sec. 18-428.1 Other Penetrations. Section deleted. No longer required, 2012 IRC was 
corrected.

Sec. 18-441. Amendments to Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency. Amendment recommended 
by NCTCOG to satisfy the “not less restrictive” requirement when adopting subsequent 
editions of energy codes in accordance with Texas SB 5, 77th Legislature. 



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 1 of 3

TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS

ORDINANCE NO. ______

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS AMENDING 
CHAPTER 18 (BUILDING AND BUILDING REGULATIONS) OF THE 
CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN BY AMENDING VARIOUS 
PROVISIONS OF ARTICLE VII (HOUSING CODE) THEREOF, 
INCLUDING: SECTIONS 18-401 (ADOPTED), AND ADOPTING THE 
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2012 EDITION, INCLUDING 
CERTAIN APPENDICES THERETO (BUT CONTINUING IN EFFECT 
PORTIONS OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2006), 18-
421 (DELETIONS, AMENDMENTS AND ADDITIONS GENERALLY), 18-
422 (PERMIT EXPIRATION), 18-423 (EXEMPTED WORK), 18-424 
(CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY),  18-425 (BUILDING/FIRE CODE 
BOARD OF APPEALS), 18-426 (VIOLATION PENALTIES), 18-426.1 
(DEFINITIONS), 18-427 (EXTERIOR WALLS), 18-428 (UNITY 
AGREEMENTS), SECTION 18-428.3 (WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING 
DWELLINGS), 18-430 (DISPOSAL OF CONSTRUCTION WASTE), 18-431
(EXCAVATION, CONSTRUCTION AND DEMOLITION AT NIGHT
PROHIBITED), 18-432 (STORMWATER RUNOFF), 18-433 (BUILDING 
SECURITY), 18-434  (AIRPORT NOISE), 18-435 (EXTERIOR PLASTER),
18-436 (EXTERIOR INSULATION AND FINISH SYSTEM (EIFS)), 18-436.1 
(SEWER DEPTH), 436.2 (ROOF EXTENSION), 18-437 (ADMINISTRATIVE 
APPROVAL), 18-438 (LOCATION OF CLEAR SPACES), 18-439 (MINIMUM
SIZE OF CONDUCTORS), 18-440 (SERVICE DISCONNECT LOCATION),
AND 18-441 (AMENDMENTS TO CHAPTER 11 ENERGY EFFICIENCY); 
DELETING SECTION 18-428.1 (OTHER PENETRATIONS) TO THE CODE 
OF ORDINANCES; PROVIDING A SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING A 
PENALTY NOT TO EXCEED THE SUM OF FIVE HUNDRED DOLLARS
($500.00) FOR EACH OFFENSE, AND A SEPARATE OFFENSE SHALL BE 
DEEMED COMMITTED EACH DAY DURING OR ON WHICH A 
VIOLATION OCCURS OR CONTINUES; PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY 
CLAUSE; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, the amendments set forth in this Ordinance to Chapter 18 of the Code of 
Ordinances of the Town of Addison, Texas (the “City”) are pursuant to investigation and 
analysis by the City, and are with a view of and to further the purposes and objectives set forth in 
Section 18-31 of the Code, including to promote the health, safety, welfare, convenience and 
enjoyment of the public, including to protect the public welfare, and are to comply with 
applicable State law; and

WHEREAS, among other things, this Ordinance continues in effect the provisions of the 
International Residential Code, 2006 Edition for purposes of the amendment thereto set forth in 
Section 18-429 of the Code of Ordinances, and the City Council hereby finds that the 
requirements included in and provisions of the said Section 18-429 have been in effect prior to 
January 1, 2009, and that the continuation of those requirements and provisions by this 



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 2 of 3

Ordinance is not and does not constitute the enactment of an ordinance, bylaw, order, building 
code, or rule requiring the installation of a multipurpose residential fire protection sprinkler 
system or any other fire sprinkler protection system in a new or existing one- or two-family 
dwelling after January 1, 2009; and

WHEREAS, the adoption of this Ordinance and the amendments set forth herein are for 
and in the best interests of the health, safety and welfare of the City and its citizens.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS:

Section 1. Incorporation of Recitals.  The above and foregoing recitals and premises 
to this Ordinance are true and correct and are incorporated herein and made a part hereof for all 
purposes.

Section 2. Amendment.  The Code of Ordinances of the Town of Addison, Texas 
(the “City”) is hereby amended by amending certain sections and provisions of Chapter 18 
(Building and Building Regulations), Article VII (Housing Code) thereof as set forth in Exhibit 
A attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes, and all other chapters, articles, 
sections, subsections, sentences, phrases and words of the said Code of Ordinances are not 
amended hereby.

Section 3. Savings; Repealer.  This Ordinance shall be cumulative of all other 
ordinances of the City and shall not repeal any of the provisions of those ordinances except in 
those instances where the provisions of those ordinances are in direct conflict with the provisions 
of this Ordinance.  Provided, however, that the repeal of such ordinances or parts of such 
ordinances, and the amendments and changes made by this Ordinance, shall not affect any right, 
property or claim which was or is vested in the City, or any act done, or right accruing or 
accrued, or established, or any suit, action or proceeding had or commenced before the time 
when this Ordinance shall take effect; nor shall said repeals, amendments or changes affect any 
offense committed, or any penalty or forfeiture incurred, or any suit or prosecution pending at 
the time when this Ordinance shall take effect under any of the ordinances or sections thereof so 
repealed, amended or changed; and to that extent and for that purpose the provisions of such 
ordinances or parts of such ordinances shall be deemed to remain and continue in full force and
effect.

Section 4. Penalty.  It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, corporation, or other 
business entity to violate any provision of this Ordinance, and any person, firm, corporation, or 
other business entity violating or failing to comply with any provision hereof shall be fined, upon 
conviction, in an amount of not more than Five Hundred and No/100 Dollars ($500.00), and a 
separate offense shall be deemed committed each day during or on which a violation or failure 
occurs or continues.

Section 5. Severability.  The provisions of this Ordinance are severable, and if any 
section or provision of this Ordinance or the application of any section or provision to any 
person, firm, corporation, entity, situation or circumstance is for any reason adjudged invalid or 
held unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, the same shall not affect the validity 



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 3 of 3

of any other section or provision of this Ordinance or the application of any other section or 
provision to any other person, firm, corporation, entity, situation or circumstance, and the City 
Council declares that it would have adopted the valid portions of this Ordinance adopted herein 
without the invalid or unconstitutional parts and to this end the provisions of this Ordinance 
adopted herein shall remain in full force and effect.

Section 6. Effective Date.  This Ordinance shall become effective from and after its 
passage and approval and its publication as may be required by law (including, without 
limitation, the City Charter and the ordinances of the City).

PASSED AND APPROVED by the City Council of the Town of Addison, Texas this
___ day of _________, 2014.

Todd Meier, Mayor

ATTEST:

By:
Matt McCombs, City Secretary

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

By:
John Hill, City Attorney



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. ________
Page 1 of 9

EXHIBIT A
TO ORDINANCE NO. __________

Chapter 18 (Building and Building Regulations), of the Code of Ordinances (the “Code”) 
of the Town of Addison, Texas is hereby amended by amending various sections of Article VII 
(Housing Code) thereof as set forth below and as follows (additions are underlined; deletions are
struck-through):

1. Section 18-401 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-401. Adopted.

For the purpose of providing minimum standards to safeguard life or limb, health, 
property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction, 
quality of materials used, use and occupancy, location and maintenance of all buildings 
and structures within the city and certain equipment specifically regulated herein, the 
International Residential Code, 20122009 Edition (for purposes of this Article, the “
20122009 International Residential Code,” a copy of which, authenticated by the 
signature of the mayor and the city secretary, and made a public record by ordinance, is 
on file in the city secretary’s office), is hereby adopted as the building code of the city as 
fully as if copied at length in this article, but with the changes therein and additions 
thereto to provided in this article.  Also, adopted are Appendices E, F, G, H, I, J and K
of the 20122009 International Residential Code.

Notwithstanding the adoption of the 20122009 International Residential Code, Section 
R325 of the International Residential Code, 2006 Edition (for purposes of this Article, the 
“International Residential Code”), as added by an amendment to the International 
Residential Code as set forth in Section 18-429, below, and any provisions of the 
International Residential Code (including, without limitation, any appendices) that are 
deemed by  the Building Official of the Town of Addison to be necessary for or useful to 
the application, interpretation, and/or enforcement of the said Section R325, are 
continued in full force and effect. To the extent of any conflict between the provisions of 
the International Residential Code as continued hereby and the provisions of the
20122009 International Residential Code, the provisions of the International Residential 
Code shall control.

Section R313 of the 20122009 International Residential Code is not adopted hereby and 
is excluded from the adoption of the 20122009 International Residential Code.

2. All references to the “2009 International Residential Code” included in Sections 18-421 
through 18-428, and in Sections 18-430 through 18-441, shall mean and are amended to read
“20122009 International Residential Code”.

3. Section 18-421of the Code is amended to read as follows:



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. ________
Page 2 of 9

Sec. 18-421.  Deletions, amendments and additions generally.

The 20122009 International Residential Code, as adopted in this article, is hereby 
modified by deletions, amendments and additions provided herein.

4. Section 18-422 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-422 Permit Expiration.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by changing subsection 
R105.5 and adding subsection R105.5.1 to read as follows:

R105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work 
authorized by such permit is commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if 
the work authorized by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 
days after the time work is commenced. All work commenced under a building 
permit shall be completed within 18 months. The building official is authorized 
to grant, in writing, an extension of time, for a period of not more than 180 days.
The extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated. No 
permit shall be extended more than once.

R105.5.1 New permits required. A new permit must be obtained for any 
construction which is not completed within the allowable time period or extended 
as provided above.  A new fee shall be required in connection with the issuance of 
a new permit. The new fee shall be the amount required for the original permit for 
such work, provided no changes have been made or will be made in the original 
plans and specifications for such work. A new permit must be obtained for any 
construction which has been suspended or abandoned for a period of more than 
180 days. The permittee shall make new application, resubmit plans for review, 
and pay a new full permit fee to resume work.

5. Section 18-423 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-423.  Exempted work.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by deleting items 1 
and 2 from subsection R105.2.

6. Section 18- 424 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-424.  Certificate of Occupancy.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by deleting section 
R110.

7. Section 18-425 of the Code is amended to read as follows;



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. ________
Page 3 of 9

Sec. 18-425.  Building/Fire Code Board of Appeals.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by amending Section 
R112 in its entirety as follows:

R112.  Building/Fire Code Board of Appeals.  For purposes of this code, appeals 
shall be to the board of appeals, being denominated as the Building/Fire Code 
Board of Appeals, which shall consist of the members of the board of adjustment 
appointed by the city council pursuant to Appendix A, Article XXIV of the Code 
of Ordinances of the Town of Addison.  The provisions applicable to the board of 
appeals as set forth in Section 112.1 and 112.2 below and described in Section 
113 of the International Building Code adopted by the town, including, without
limitation, general provisions, limitations of power, powers of the board, and 
appeal process, shall be applicable to and govern appeals and the said board of 
appeals for purposes of this code.

112.1 Determination of substantial improvement in areas prone to flooding.  
When the building official provides a finding required in Section R105.3.1.1, the 
board of appeals shall determine whether the value of the proposed work 
constitutes a substantial improvement.  A substantial improvement means any 
repair, reconstruction, rehabilitation, addition or improvement of a building or 
structure, the cost of which equals or exceeds 50 percent of the market value of 
the building or structure before the improvement or repair is started. If the 
building or structure has sustained substantial damage, all repairs are considered 
substantial improvement regardless of the actual repair work performed.  The 
term does not include:

1. Improvements of a building or structure required to correct 
existing health, sanitary or safety code violations identified by the 
building official and which are the minimum necessary to assure safe 
living conditions; or

2. Any alteration of an historic building or structure, provided that the 
alteration will not preclude the continued designation as an historic 
building or structure. For the purpose of this exclusion, an historic 
building is:

2.1. Listed or preliminarily determined to be eligible for listing 
in the National Register of Historic Places; or

2.2. Determined by the Secretary of the U.S. Department of 
Interior as contributing to the historical significance of a 
registered historic district or a district preliminarily determined to 
qualify as an historic district; or

2.3. Designated as historic under a state or local historic 
preservation program that is approved by the Department of 



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. ________
Page 4 of 9

Interior.

112.2 Criteria for issuance of a variance for areas prone to flooding.  A variance 
shall only be issued upon:

1. A showing of good and sufficient cause that the unique 
characteristics of the size, configuration or topography of the site render 
the elevation standards in Section R322 inappropriate.

2. A determination that failure to grant the variance would result in 
exceptional hardship by rendering the lot undevelopable.

3. A determination that the granting of a variance will not result in 
increased flood heights, additional threats to public safety, extraordinary 
public expense, nor create nuisances, cause fraud on or victimization of 
the public, or conflict with existing local laws or ordinances.

4. A determination that the variance is the minimum necessary to 
afford relief, considering the flood hazard.

5. Submission to the applicant of written notice specifying the 
difference between the design flood elevation and the elevation to which 
the building is to be built, stating that the cost of flood insurance will be 
commensurate with the increased risk resulting from the reduced floor 
elevation, and stating that construction below the design flood elevation 
increases risks to life and property.

8. Section 18-426 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-426.  Violation penalties.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by changing subsection 
R113.4 to read as follows:

R113.4 Violation penalties.  See subsection 114.4 of the International Building 
Code.

9. Section 18-426.1 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-426.1. Definitions.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by changing the 
definition of Townhouse in Section 202 to read as follows:

Townhouse. A single family dwelling unit constructed in a group of attached units 
separated by property lines in which each unit extends from the foundation to roof 
and with open space on at least two sides.



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. ________
Page 5 of 9

10. Section 18-427 of the Code is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

Sec. 18-427.  Exterior Walls.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by changing exception 
3 in subsection R302.1 to read as follows:

Exception 3. Detached tool sheds and storage sheds, playhouses and similar 
structures where the floor areas does not exceed 200 square feet are not required 
to provide wall protection based on location on the lot.  Projections beyond the 
exterior wall shall not extend over the lot line.

11. Section 18-428 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-428.  Unity Agreements.

The 20122009 International Residential code is amended by adding Exception 6 
to section R302.1 to read as follows:

Exception 6 Unity agreement. See Section 705.15 of the International Building 
Code.

12. The Code of Ordinances is amended by deleting Section 18-428.1 in its entirety;

Sec. 18-428.1 Other penetrations.

The 2009 International Residential Code is amended by changing Section 
R302.5.3 to read as follows:

R302.5.3 Other penetrations. Penetrations through the separation required in 
Section R302, shall be protected as required by Section R302.11, Item 11.

13. Section 18-428.3 is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-428.3. Where required in existing dwellings.

The 2012 International Residential Code is amended by changing Section R315.3R315.2
to read as follows:

R315.3R315.2 Where required in existing dwellings. Where work requiring a permit 
occurs in existing dwellings that have attached garages or in existing dwellings within 
which fuel-fired appliances exist, carbon monoxide alarms shall be provided in 
accordance with Section R315.1.

Exceptions:



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. ________
Page 6 of 9

1. Work involving the exterior surfaces of dwellings, such as replacement of roofing or 
siding, or the addition or replacement of windows or doors, or the addition of a porch 
or deck, are exempt from the requirements of this section.

2. Installation, alteration or repairs of electrical, or plumbing and mechanical systems 
inside the dwelling that does not involve the installation, alteration or repairs of gas 
lines or gas appliances are exempt from the requirements of this section.

14. Section 18-430 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-430.  Disposal of Construction Waste.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by adding Section R324 to read 
as follows:

SECTION R324

DISPOSAL OF CONSTRUCTION WASTE

R324.1 General.  See Section 33143313 of the International Building Code.

15. Section 18-431 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-431.  Excavation, Construction or Demolition at night prohibited.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by adding Section R325 to read 
as follows:

SECTION R325

EXCAVATION, CONSTRUCTION OR DEMOLITION AT NIGHT PROHIBITED

R325.1 General.  See Section 33153314 of the International Building Code.

16. Section 18-432 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-432.  Stormwater Runoff.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by adding Section R326 to read 
as follows:

SECTION R326
STORMWATER RUNOFF

R326.1 General.  See Section 33163315 of the International Building Code.



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. ________
Page 7 of 9

17. Section 18-433 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-433.  Building Security.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by adding Section R327 to read 
as follows:

SECTION R327

BUILDING SECURITY

R327.1 General.  See Chapter 36 of the International Building Code.

18. Section 18-434 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-434.  Airport Noise.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by adding Section R329R328
to read as follows:

SECTION R328

AIRPORT NOISE

R329.1 General.  See Chapter 37 of the International Building Code.

19. Section 18-435 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-435.  Exterior Plaster.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by adding subsection R703.6.6
to read as follows:

R703.6 3/8" One-coat stucco system. See subsection 2512.10 of the International 
Building Code.

20. Section 18-436 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-436.  Exterior insulation and finish system (EIFS).

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by adding subsection R703.9.5
to read as follows:

R703.9.5 Requirements:  In addition to the above requirements the exterior insulation and 
finish system shall comply with subsection 1408.6 of the International Building Code.

21. Section 18-436.1 of the Code is amended to read as follows:



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. ________
Page 8 of 9

Sec. 18-436.1. Sewer depth.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by changing Section P2603.6.1 
to read as follows:

P2603.6.1 Sewer depth. Building sewers shall be a minimum of 12 inches (304 mm) 
below grade.

22. Section 18-436.2. of the Code is amended to read as follows:

P3103.1 Roof extension.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by changing Sectionsubsection
P3103.1 to read as follows:

P3103.1 Roof extensions. All vent pipes which extend through a roof shall be terminated 
at least 6 inches (152 mm) above the roof except that where a roof is to be used for any 
purpose other than weather protection, the vent extensions shall run a least 7 feet (2.134 
mm) above the roof.

23. Section 18-437 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-437.  Administrative approval.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by adding subsection P3114.9
to read as follows:

P3114.9  Administrative approval. The administration shall have final approval of all 
location of air admittance valves.

24. Section 18-438 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-438.  Location of clear spaces.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by adding a sentence to 
subsection E3405.4 to read as follows:

Overcurrent devices shall be permitted in clothes closets if the working clearances 
required in subsection E3305.2 are maintained.

25. Section 18-439 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-439.  Minimum size of conductors.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by changing the first sentence 



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. ________
Page 9 of 9

of subsection E3406.3 to read as follows:

The minimum size of conductors for feeders and branch circuits shall be No. 14 copper 
and aluminum conductors shall be No. 8 or larger and shall not be used on branch 
circuits.

26. Section 18-440 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-440.  Service disconnect location.

The 20122009 International Residential Code is amended by adding sentences to 
subsection E3601.6.2 to read as follows:

Unfused service entrance conductors entering buildings shall be enclosed in rigid metal 
conduit, wireways, auxiliary gutters, or as busways.  Unfused service conductors 
extending within the building above the third floor shall be enclosed in at least two inches 
of concrete, except in meter rooms.

27. Section 18-441 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-441. Amendments to Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency.

Part IV – Energy Conservation - Chapter 11 [RE] Insert text to read as follows: 

Residential Provisions for Energy EfficiencyThe 2009 International Residential Code is 
amended by changing Section N1101.2.1, N1102.1 and N1102.2.12 to read as follows:

N1101.2.1. Compliance software tools. Software tools used to demonstrate energy code 
compliance utilizing the UA alternate approach shall be approved by the building official. 
The PNL program REScheckTM is not acceptable for residential compliance.

            Exception: When REScheckTM “UA Trade-off” compliance approach or the UA 
Alternative compliance approach is used, the compliance certificate must demonstrate 
that the maximum glazed area does not exceed 15% of the conditioned floor area.

N1102.1. Insulation and fenestration criteria. The building thermal envelope shall meet 
the requirements of table N1102.1 based on the climate zone specified in Table N1101.2. 
The use of Tables N1102.1 and N1102.2.2 are limited to a maximum glazing area of 15% 
window to floor area ratio. 

N110.2.12. Insulation installed in walls. Insulation batts installed in walls shall be totally 
surrounded by an enclosure on all sides consisting of framing lumber, gypsum, sheathing, 
wood structural panel sheathing or other equivalent material approved by the building 
official.



To: Charles Goff , Assistant Director Development Services and Planning

From: Lynn Chandler, Building Official

Date: September 8, 2012

Subject: 2012 IPC, IFGC, IPSDC

The following changes were made to the Code of  Ordinance:

Sec. 18-341. Adopted. Text was changed to read 2012 Editions.

Sec. 18-364. Licensing and registration of contractors. Changed homeowner to read 
homesteader because homeowner could use home as rental property.

Sec. 18-366. Fee refunds. Changed subsection 106.5.3 to read 106.6.2.

Sec. 18-367. Changed subsection 305.6.1 to read 305.4.1  and rewrote section on 
recommendation from NCTCOG.

Sec. 18-368. Partitions. Changed section 310.4 and 310.5 to read 405.3.4 and 405.3.5.

Sec. 18-371. Grease traps and grease interceptors.  Changed section to be consistent with 
the Health Department requirements. 



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY                                        ORDINANCE NO. _________
Page 1 of 2

                     TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS

                                                      ORDINANCE NO. ________

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS AMENDING 
CHAPTER 18 BUILDING AND BUILDING REGULATIONS, OF THE CODE 
OF ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN BY AMENDING VARIOUS 
PROVISIONS OF ARTICLE III (PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE) 
THEREOF, INCLUDING: SECTIONS 18-101 (ADOPTED); PROVIDING A 
SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING A PENALTY NOT TO EXCEED THE 
SUM OF FIVE HUNDRED DOLLARS ($500.00) FOR EACH OFFENSE AND 
A SEPARATE OFFENSE SHALL BE DEEMED COMMITTED EACH DAY 
DURING OR ON WHICH A VIOLATION OCCURS OR CONTINUES; 
PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE 
DATE.

WHEREAS, the amendments set forth in this Ordinance to Chapter 18 are pursuant to 
investigation and analysis by the City, and are with a view of and to further the purposes and 
objectives set forth in Section 18-31 of the Code, including to promote the health, safety, 
welfare, convenience and enjoyment of the public, including to protect the public welfare, and 
are to comply with applicable State law; and

WHEREAS, the adoption of this Ordinance and the amendments set forth herein are for 
and in the best interests of the health, safety and welfare of the City and its citizens.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS:

Section 1. Incorporation of Recitals.  The above and foregoing recitals and premises 
to this Ordinance are true and correct and are incorporated herein and made a part hereof for all 
purposes.

Section 2. Amendment.  The Code of Ordinances of the Town of Addison, Texas 
(the “City”) is hereby amended by amending certain sections and provisions of Chapter 18, 
Building and Building Regulations, thereof as set forth in Exhibit A attached hereto and 
incorporated herein for all purposes, and all other chapters, articles, sections, subsections, 
sentences, phrases and words of the said Code of Ordinances are not amended hereby.

Section 3. Savings; Repealer.  This Ordinance shall be cumulative of all other 
ordinances of the City and shall not repeal any of the provisions of those ordinances except in 
those instances where the provisions of those ordinances are in direct conflict with the provisions 
of this Ordinance.  Provided, however, that the repeal of such ordinances or parts of such 
ordinances, and the amendments and changes made by this Ordinance, shall not affect any right, 
property or claim which was or is vested in the City, or any act done, or right accruing or 
accrued, or established, or any suit, action or proceeding had or commenced before the time 



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY                                        ORDINANCE NO. _________
Page 2 of 2

when this Ordinance shall take effect; nor shall said repeals, amendments or changes affect any 
offense committed, or any penalty or forfeiture incurred, or any suit or prosecution pending at 
the time when this Ordinance shall take effect under any of the ordinances or sections thereof so 
repealed, amended or changed; and to that extent and for that purpose the provisions of such 
ordinances or parts of such ordinances shall be deemed to remain and continue in full force and 
effect.

Section 4. Penalty.  It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, corporation, or other 
business entity to violate any provision of this Ordinance, and any person, firm, corporation, or 
other business entity violating or failing to comply with any provision hereof shall be fined, upon 
conviction, in an amount of not more than Five Hundred and No/100 Dollars ($500.00), and a 
separate offense shall be deemed committed each day during or on which a violation or failure 
occurs or continues.

Section 5. Severability.  The provisions of this Ordinance are severable, and if any 
section or provision of this Ordinance or the application of any section or provision to any 
person, firm, corporation, entity, situation or circumstance is for any reason adjudged invalid or 
held unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, the same shall not affect the validity 
of any other section or provision of this Ordinance or the application of any other section or 
provision to any other person, firm, corporation, entity, situation or circumstance, and the City 
Council declares that it would have adopted the valid portions of this Ordinance adopted herein 
without the invalid or unconstitutional parts and to this end the provisions of this Ordinance 
adopted herein shall remain in full force and effect.

Section 6. Effective Date.  This Ordinance shall become effective from and after its 
passage and approval and its publication as may be required by law (including, without 
limitation, the City Charter and the ordinances of the City).

PASSED AND APPROVED by the City Council of the Town of Addison, Texas this.

Todd Meier , Mayor

ATTEST:

By:
Matt McCombs, City Secretary

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

By:
John Hill, City Attorney



EXHIBIT A TO ORDINANCE NO. _______
Page 1 of 2



Exhibit A to Ordinance No. ______
Page 2 of 2 

                                                             EXHIBIT A
TO ORDINANCE NO. __________

1. Section 18-101 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

            Sec. 18-101. Adopted.

The rules and regulations of the International Property Maintenance Code, 2012 
2009   Edition, a copy of which, authenticated by the signature of the mayor and the city 
secretary, and made a public record by ordinance, are hereby adopted as the rules and 
regulations to provide a just, equitable and practicable method to be cumulative with and 
in addition to, any other remedy provided by the International Building Code, 2012 2009   
Edition, or otherwise available at law, whereby buildings or health, morals, property, 
safety or welfare of the general public or their occupants may be required to be repaired.  
The International Property Maintenance Code, 2012 2009   Edition, is hereby adopted, a 
copy of which is attached to the ordinance from which this section is derived and made a 
part hereof for all purposes.

.



To: Charles Goff, Assistant Director Development Services and Planning

From: Lynn Chandler, Building Official

Date: September 8, 2014

Subject: 2014 NEC

The following changes were made to the Code of Ordinance:

Sec. 18-241. Supervision of electrical work was changed that an electrician of the proper 
grade will be physically on site to insure the proper supervision. Homeowner was 
changed to read homesteader because homeowner could use home as rental property. 

Sec. 18-246. Adopted. Text changed to read 2014 NEC.

Sec. 18-268 Unfused service entrance conductors was deleted to conform to basic 
requirements of the NEC.



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 1 of 3

TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS

                                                     ORDINANCE NO. _________

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS AMENDING 
CHAPTER 18, BUILDING AND BUILDING REGULATIONS, OF THE 
CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN BY AMENDING VARIOUS 
PROVISIONS OF ARTICLE IV (ELECTRICAL CODE) THEREOF, 
INCLUDING: SECTIONS 18-141 (SUPERVISION OF ELECTRICAL 
WORK); AND 18-241 (ADOPTED);  PROVIDING A SAVINGS CLAUSE; 
PROVIDING A PENALTY NOT TO EXCEED THE SUM OF FIVE 
HUNDRED DOLLARS ($500.00)  FOR EACH OFFENSE AND A SEPARATE 
OFFENSE SHALL BE DEEMED COMMITTED EACH DAY DURING OR 
ON WHICH A VIOLATION OCCURS OR CONTINUES; PROVIDING A 
SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, the amendments set forth in this Ordinance to Chapter 18 are pursuant to 
investigation and analysis by the City, and are with a view of and to further the purposes and 
objectives set forth in Section 18-31 of the Code, including to promote the health, safety, 
welfare, convenience and enjoyment of the public, including to protect the public welfare, and 
are to comply with applicable State law; and

WHEREAS, the adoption of this Ordinance and the amendments set forth herein are for 
and in the best interests of the health, safety and welfare of the City and its citizens.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS:

Section 1. Incorporation of Recitals.  The above and foregoing recitals and premises 
to this Ordinance are true and correct and are incorporated herein and made a part hereof for all 
purposes.

Section 2. Amendment.  The Code of Ordinances of the Town of Addison, Texas 
(the “City”) is hereby amended by amending certain sections and provisions of Chapter 18, 
Building and Building Regulations, thereof as set forth in Exhibit A attached hereto and 
incorporated herein for all purposes, and all other chapters, articles, sections, subsections, 
sentences, phrases and words of the said Code of Ordinances are not amended hereby.

Section 3. Savings; Repealer.  This Ordinance shall be cumulative of all other 
ordinances of the City and shall not repeal any of the provisions of those ordinances except in 
those instances where the provisions of those ordinances are in direct conflict with the provisions 
of this Ordinance.  Provided, however, that the repeal of such ordinances or parts of such 
ordinances, and the amendments and changes made by this Ordinance, shall not affect any right, 
property or claim which was or is vested in the City, or any act done, or right accruing or 



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 2 of 3

accrued, or established, or any suit, action or proceeding had or commenced before the time 
when this Ordinance shall take effect; nor shall said repeals, amendments or changes affect any 
offense committed, or any penalty or forfeiture incurred, or any suit or prosecution pending at 
the time when this Ordinance shall take effect under any of the ordinances or sections thereof so 
repealed, amended or changed; and to that extent and for that purpose the provisions of such 
ordinances or parts of such ordinances shall be deemed to remain and continue in full force and 
effect.

Section 4. Penalty.  It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, corporation, or other 
business entity to violate any provision of this Ordinance, and any person, firm, corporation, or 
other business entity violating or failing to comply with any provision hereof shall be fined, upon 
conviction, in an amount of not more than Five Hundred and No/100 Dollars ($500.00), and a 
separate offense shall be deemed committed each day during or on which a violation or failure 
occurs or continues.

Section 5. Severability.  The provisions of this Ordinance are severable, and if any 
section or provision of this Ordinance or the application of any section or provision to any 
person, firm, corporation, entity, situation or circumstance is for any reason adjudged invalid or 
held unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, the same shall not affect the validity 
of any other section or provision of this Ordinance or the application of any other section or 
provision to any other person, firm, corporation, entity, situation or circumstance, and the City 
Council declares that it would have adopted the valid portions of this Ordinance adopted herein 
without the invalid or unconstitutional parts and to this end the provisions of this Ordinance 
adopted herein shall remain in full force and effect.

Section 6. Effective Date.  This Ordinance shall become effective from and after its 
passage and approval and its publication as may be required by law (including, without 
limitation, the City Charter and the ordinances of the City).

PASSED AND APPROVED by the City Council of the Town of Addison, Texas this 
day of                             2014.

Todd Meier, Mayor                            
ATTEST:

By:
Matt McCombs, City Secretary

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

By:
John Hill, City Attorney



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 3 of 3

EXHIBIT A

TO ORDINANCE NO. __________

Chapter 18, Building and Building Regulations, of the Code of Ordinances (the “Code”) 
of the Town of Addison, Texas is hereby amended by amending various sections of the said 
Code as set forth below and as follows (additions are underlined; deletions are):

Section 1.  Section 18-141 of the Code is amended to read as follows;

          Sec. 18-141. Supervision of electrical work.

(a) In the actual work of installing, maintaining, altering, or repairing any electrical 
conductor or equipment for which a permit or voucher is required, apprentice
electricians shall be directly supervised (physically on site) by a higher grade 
classification, as defined by the State of Texas in Title 8, Occupational Code Chapter 
1305 administrated by the Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation for proper 
grade classification of electrical license when electrical work is being done there shall 
be present and in direct supervision a qualified electrician of the proper classification. 
Should it come to the notice of the building official that proper supervision and control 
are not being maintained, the building official may order work to be discontinued, and 
the person to whom the permit or voucher has been issued shall discontinue further 
work until proper supervision has been employed or supplied; provided, that this 
requirement does not prohibit the employment of apprentices or unskilled laborers 
assisting a person duly registered and qualified under the provisions of Article IV 
Chapter 18 of the Addison Code.

(b) A homesteader homeowner may perform electrical work without the above mentioned 
supervision under the following conditions;

(1) A homesteader homeowner may personally install electrical conductors or 
equipment within his own home if the homesteader owner files with the building 
official approved plans and specifications, satisfies the building official as to his 
ability to install electrical wiring, applies and secures a permit., pays required fees, 
does work in accordance with Article IV of Chapter 18 of the Addison Code, and 
applies for inspections.

(2) Work performed by a homesteader homeowner under the provisions of this section 
must be done by himself on homestead premises owned and occupied by him, 
without compensation. A homeowner shall not employ another person to assist 
him in any way on the work.

Section 2.  . Section 18-246 of the Code is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

            Sec. 18-246. Adopted



EXHIBIT A TO ORDINANCE NO. __________
Page 5 of 5 

(a)  The rules and regulations of the International Fire Protection Association 
embodied in the National Electrical Code,2014 2008 edition, are hereby adopted as the 
rules and regulations to govern and be observed and followed in all the construction, 
installation, repair, alteration, operation and maintenance of electrical wiring, apparatus 
and fixtures in the town.

(c) The National Electrical Code,2014 2008 edition (a copy of which authenticated by the 
signature of the mayor and city secretary, and made a public record by ordinance, is on 
file in the city secretary’s office) is hereby adopted as the National Electrical Code of 
the town as fully as if copied at length in this article, but with the changes therein and 
additions in this article.

Section 3. The Code of Ordinances is amended by deleting Sec. 18-268. Unfused service 
entrance conductors.

Section 230.70(A) (1) of the National Electrical Code is amended by adding the following:

Unfused service entrance conductors entering buildings shall be enclosed in rigid metal conduit, 
rigid nonmetallic conduit, intermediate metal conduit, wireways, auxiliary gutters, or as 
busways. Unfused service entrance conductors extending within buildings above the third floor 
shall be enclosed in at least two inches of concrete, except in meter rooms. 



To: Charles Goff , Assistant Director Development Services and Planning

From: Lynn Chandler, Building Official

Date: September 8, 2012

Subject: 2012 IPC, IFGC, IPSDC

The following changes were made to the Code of  Ordinance:

Sec. 18-341. Adopted. Text was changed to read 2012 Editions.

Sec. 18-364. Licensing and registration of contractors. Changed homeowner to read 
homesteader because homeowner could use home as rental property.

Sec. 18-366. Fee refunds. Changed subsection 106.5.3 to read 106.6.2.

Sec. 18-367. Changed subsection 305.6.1 to read 305.4.1  and rewrote section on 
recommendation from NCTCOG.

Sec. 18-368. Partitions. Changed section 310.4 and 310.5 to read 405.3.4 and 405.3.5.

Sec. 18-371. Grease traps and grease interceptors.  Changed section to be consistent with 
the Health Department requirements. 



                                                    ORDINANCE NO. _________

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS AMENDING
CHAPTER 18, BUILDING AND BUILDING REGULATIONS, OF THE 
CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN BY AMENDING VARIOUS 
PROVISIONS OF ARTICLE VI (PLUMBING CODE) THEREOF 
INCLUDING; SECTIONS 18-341 (ADPOTED) (AND ADOPTING THE 
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, 2012 EDITION, 18-364 (LICENSING 
AND REGISTRATION OF CONTRACTORS); 18-366 FEE REFUNDS; 18-368 
PARTITIONS; 18-370 ADMINISTRATIVE APPROVAL; AND 18-371 
GREASE TRAPS AND GREASE INTERCEPTORS; PROVIDING A 
SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING A PENALTY NOT TO EXCEED THE 
SUM OF FIVE HUNDRED DOLLARS ($500.00) FOR EACH OFFENSE AND 
A SEPARATE OFFENSE SHALL BE DEEMED COMMITTED EACH DAY 
DURING OR ON WHICH A VIOLATION OCCURS OR CONTINUES; 
PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE 
DATE.

WHEREAS, the amendments set forth in this Ordinance to Chapter 18 are pursuant to 
investigation and analysis by the City, and are with a view of and to further the purposes and 
objectives set forth in Section 18-31 of the Code, including to promote the health, safety, 
welfare, convenience and enjoyment of the public, including to protect the public welfare, and 
are to comply with applicable State law; and

WHEREAS, the adoption of this Ordinance and the amendments set forth herein are for 
and in the best interests of the health, safety and welfare of the City and its citizens.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS:



Section 1. Incorporation of Recitals.  The above and foregoing recitals and premises 
to this Ordinance are true and correct and are incorporated herein and made a part hereof for all 
purposes.

Section 2. Amendment.  The Code of Ordinances of the Town of Addison, Texas 
(the “City”) is hereby amended by amending certain sections and provisions of Chapter 18, 
Building and Building Regulations, thereof as set forth in Exhibit A attached hereto and 
incorporated herein for all purposes, and all other chapters, articles, sections, subsections, 
sentences, phrases and words of the said Code of Ordinances are not amended hereby.

Section 3. Savings; Repealer.  This Ordinance shall be cumulative of all other 
ordinances of the City and shall not repeal any of the provisions of those ordinances except in 
those instances where the provisions of those ordinances are in direct conflict with the provisions 
of this Ordinance.  Provided, however, that the repeal of such ordinances or parts of such 
ordinances, and the amendments and changes made by this Ordinance, shall not affect any right, 
property or claim which was or is vested in the City, or any act done, or right accruing or 
accrued, or established, or any suit, action or proceeding had or commenced before the time 
when this Ordinance shall take effect; nor shall said repeals, amendments or changes affect any 
offense committed, or any penalty or forfeiture incurred, or any suit or prosecution pending at 
the time when this Ordinance shall take effect under any of the ordinances or sections thereof so 
repealed, amended or changed; and to that extent and for that purpose the provisions of such 
ordinances or parts of such ordinances shall be deemed to remain and continue in full force and 
effect.

Section 4. Penalty.  It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, corporation, or other 
business entity to violate any provision of this Ordinance, and any person, firm, corporation, or 
other business entity violating or failing to comply with any provision hereof shall be fined, upon 
conviction, in an amount of not more than Five Hundred and No/100 Dollars ($500.00), and a 
separate offense shall be deemed committed each day during or on which a violation or failure 
occurs or continues.

Section 5. Severability.  The provisions of this Ordinance are severable, and if any 
section or provision of this Ordinance or the application of any section or provision to any 
person, firm, corporation, entity, situation or circumstance is for any reason adjudged invalid or 
held unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, the same shall not affect the validity 



of any other section or provision of this Ordinance or the application of any other section or 
provision to any other person, firm, corporation, entity, situation or circumstance, and the City 
Council declares that it would have adopted the valid portions of this Ordinance adopted herein 
without the invalid or unconstitutional parts and to this end the provisions of this Ordinance 
adopted herein shall remain in full force and effect.

Section 6. Effective Date.  This Ordinance shall become effective from and after its 
passage and approval and its publication as may be required by law (including, without 
limitation, the City Charter and the ordinances of the City).

PASSED AND APPROVED by the City Council of the Town of Addison, Texas this.

Todd Meier, Mayor

ATTEST:

By:
Matt McCombs, City Secretary

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

By:
John Hill, City Attorney



1. Section 18-341 of the Code

Sec. 18-341. Adopted.

(a)

The rules and regulations
Gas Code, and the
Editions, are hereby
design, construction,
maintenance of plumbing

(b)

The International
Private Sewage Disposal
authenticated by the
public record by ordinance,
adopted as the plumbing
article, but with the
this article.

2. Section 18-364 of the Code

Sec. 18-364. Licensing and registration

The International
as follows:

106.7. Licensing.
(a)

No person,
installation,
modification
plumbing
required for

(b)

To register
application

Code is amended to read as follows:

regulations of the International Plumbing Code, International
the International Private Sewage Disposal Code, 2012

hereby adopted as the rules and regulations and controlling
construction, installation, quality of materials, location, operation

plumbing apparatus and fixtures within the city.

Plumbing Code, International Fuel Gas Code and
Disposal Code, 2012  2009 Editions (copies of which,
the signature of the mayor and the city secretary,
ordinance, are on file in the city secretary's office)

plumbing code of the city as fully as if copied at length
the following changes therein and additions thereto

is amended to read as follows:

registration of contractors.

Plumbing Code is amended by adding subsection

person, corporation, firm, or contractor shall engage in
installation, construction, maintenance, service, repair, alteration
modification of a product or a plumbing system unless licensed

or irrigation contractor by the town. However, no
for work that is not required to be permitted.

register with the town as a plumbing or irrigation contractor,
application shall be made in writing on forms furnished for

International Fuel
2012 2009

controlling the
operation and

and International
which,

secretary, and made a
office) are hereby

length in this
thereto provided in

subsection 106.7 to read

in the design,
alteration or
licensed as a

no license is

contractor, an
for that purpose,



and filed with
of the person's
registration
1.

Plumbing
2.

Irrigation

Exception:
registered

(c)

The plumbing
year from

(d)

The contractor
Code of Ordinances

(e)

Any person
shall be licensed

3. Section 18-366 of the Code

Sec. 18-366. Fee refunds.

        The International Gas Code

Subsection 106.6.3 of the
the International Fuel Gas
Sewage Disposable Code

"The building official

4. Section 18-367 of the Code

Sec. 18-367 Sewer depth.

The International Plumbing
read as follows:

with the building official. This application shall
person's state plumbing or irrigation licenses. The contractor

registration fees shall be as follows:

Plumbing contractor .....No fee

Irrigation contractor .....$75.00

Exception: A homesteader homeowner is not required to be
contractor to perform work in his own home.

plumbing or irrigation contractor's license shall be valid
the date of registration.

contractor shall be subject to the requirements and penalties
Ordinances of the Town of Addison.

person who installs, repairs or alters a plumbing or irrigation
licensed by the State of Texas to perform such work

is amended to read as follows:

Code is amended to read as follows:

the International Plumbing Code, subsection 106.6.2
Gas Code, and subsection 106.4.3 of the International

Code are amended to read as follows:

official is authorized to establish a refund policy."

is amended to read as follows:

Plumbing Code is amended by changing subsection 305.4

contain a copy
contractor

be licensed as a

valid for one (1)

penalties of the

irrigation system
work.

106.6.2  106.5.3 of
International Private

305.4.1  305.6.1 to



305.4.1 305.6.1. Sewer
disposal systems shall
and not less than 12
tank connection. Building
below the frost line

5. Section 18-368 of the Code is

Sec. 18-368. Partitions.

The International
and 405.3.5 310.5.

5. Section 18-370 of the Code

Sec. 18-370. Administration approval.

The International
read as follows:

918.9 917.9 Administrative
approval of all locations

6. Section 18-371 of the Code

Sec. 18-371. Grease traps and

The International
subsection 1003.3:

In addition to the
following:

Description of use

Food service establishments with 
more

Food service establishments with seating capacity of less than 
50 and with a 3-compartment sink 

Minor food service establishments as defined by administrative 
authority

Sewer depth. Building sewers that connect to private
shall be a minimum of 6 inches (152 mm) below
12 inches (305 mm) below finished grade at the
Building sewers shall be a minimum of 6 inches

line and shall not be less than 12 inches (305 mm)

amended to read as follows:

Plumbing Code is amended by deleting sections

is amended to read as follows:

approval.

Plumbing Code is amended by adding subsection

Administrative approval. The administration shall have
locations of air admittance valves.

is amended to read as follows:

and grease interceptors.

Plumbing Code is amended by adding the following

above requirements, grease traps shall comply with

Minimum Size
(In Pounds)

Food service establishments with seating capacity of 50 or 750

Food service establishments with seating capacity of less than 
compartment sink 

250

Minor food service establishments as defined by administrative 250 150

private sewage
below the frost line

point of septic
inches (152 mm)

mm) below grade.

sections 405.3.4 310.4

subsection 918.9 917.9 to

have final

following to

with the



The administrative authority may require larger grease traps in particular
businesses than shown above when it is felt that the quantity of grease may
exceed the capacity of the grease traps shown. The administrative authority may
also require grease traps for food preparation establishments other than food
service facilities.

Grease traps shall be located outside of a building or structure in an area
accessible for service.

All reference to automatic grease removal devices and food waste grinders shall
be deleted from Section 1003.



To: Charles Goff, Assistant Director Development Services and Planning

From: Lynn Chandler, Building Official

Date: September 8, 2014

Subject: 2012 IMC

The following changes were made to the Code of Ordinances:

Sec.18-291. Adopted. Text changed to read 2012 IMC.

Sec. 18-314. Licensing and registration of contractors. Changed homeowner to read 
homesteader because homeowner could use home as rental property.



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 1 of 3

                                          TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS

                                            ORDINANCE NO. ________

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS AMENDING
CHAPTER 18, BUILDING AND BUILDING REGULATIONS, OF THE 
CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN BY AMENDING VARIOUS 
PROVISIONS OF ARTICLE V (MECHANICAL CODE) THEREOF, 
INCLUDING : SECTIONS 18-291 (ADOPTED) (AND ADOPTING THE 
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, 2012 EDITION); AND 18-314 
(LICENSING AND REGISTRATION OF CONTRACTORS); PROVIDING A 
SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING A PENALTY NOT TO EXCEED THE 
SUM OF FIVE HUNDRED DOLLARS ($500.00) FOR EACH OFFENSE AND 
A SEPARATE OFFENSE SHALL BE DEEMED COMMITTED EACH DAY 
DURING OR ON WHICH A VIOLATION OCCURS OR CONTINUES; 
PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE 
DATE.

WHEREAS, the amendments set forth in this Ordinance to Chapter 18 are pursuant to 
investigation and analysis by the City, and are with a view of and to further the purposes and 
objectives set forth in Section 18-31 of the Code, including to promote the health, safety, 
welfare, convenience and enjoyment of the public, including to protect the public welfare, and 
are to comply with applicable State law; and

WHEREAS, the adoption of this Ordinance and the amendments set forth herein are for 
and in the best interests of the health, safety and welfare of the City and its citizens.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS:

Section 1. Incorporation of Recitals.  The above and foregoing recitals and premises 
to this Ordinance are true and correct and are incorporated herein and made a part hereof for all 
purposes.

Section 2. Amendment.  The Code of Ordinances of the Town of Addison, Texas 
(the “City”) is hereby amended by amending certain sections and provisions of Chapter 18, 
Building and Building Regulations, thereof as set forth in Exhibit A attached hereto and 
incorporated herein for all purposes, and all other chapters, articles, sections, subsections, 
sentences, phrases and words of the said Code of Ordinances are not amended hereby.

Section 3. Savings; Repealer.  This Ordinance shall be cumulative of all other 
ordinances of the City and shall not repeal any of the provisions of those ordinances except in 
those instances where the provisions of those ordinances are in direct conflict with the provisions 



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 2 of 3

of this Ordinance.  Provided, however, that the repeal of such ordinances or parts of such 
ordinances, and the amendments and changes made by this Ordinance, shall not affect any right, 
property or claim which was or is vested in the City, or any act done, or right accruing or 
accrued, or established, or any suit, action or proceeding had or commenced before the time 
when this Ordinance shall take effect; nor shall said repeals, amendments or changes affect any 
offense committed, or any penalty or forfeiture incurred, or any suit or prosecution pending at 
the time when this Ordinance shall take effect under any of the ordinances or sections thereof so 
repealed, amended or changed; and to that extent and for that purpose the provisions of such 
ordinances or parts of such ordinances shall be deemed to remain and continue in full force and 
effect.

Section 4. Penalty.  It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, corporation, or other 
business entity to violate any provision of this Ordinance, and any person, firm, corporation, or 
other business entity violating or failing to comply with any provision hereof shall be fined, upon 
conviction, in an amount of not more than Five Hundred and No/100 Dollars ($500.00), and a 
separate offense shall be deemed committed each day during or on which a violation or failure 
occurs or continues.

Section 5. Severability.  The provisions of this Ordinance are severable, and if any 
section or provision of this Ordinance or the application of any section or provision to any 
person, firm, corporation, entity, situation or circumstance is for any reason adjudged invalid or 
held unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, the same shall not affect the validity 
of any other section or provision of this Ordinance or the application of any other section or 
provision to any other person, firm, corporation, entity, situation or circumstance, and the City 
Council declares that it would have adopted the valid portions of this Ordinance adopted herein 
without the invalid or unconstitutional parts and to this end the provisions of this Ordinance 
adopted herein shall remain in full force and effect.

Section 6. Effective Date.  This Ordinance shall become effective from and after its 
passage and approval and its publication as may be required by law (including, without 
limitation, the City Charter and the ordinances of the City).

PASSED AND APPROVED by the City Council of the Town of Addison, Texas this      
day of                      ,2014

Todd Meier, Mayor

ATTEST:

By:
Matt McCombs, City Secretary

APPROVED AS TO FORM:



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 3 of 3

By:
John Hill, City Attorney



Exhibit A to Ordinance No._______
Page 1 of 3

EXHIBIT A
TO ORDINANCE NO. __________

1. Section 18-291 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

     Sec. 18-291. Adopted.

(a) The rules and regulations of the International Mechanical Code, 2012 2009
Edition, are hereby adopted as the rules and regulations regulating and controlling the 
design, construction, installation, quality of materials, location, operation and 
maintenance of heating, ventilating, cooling, refrigeration systems, incinerators and other 
miscellaneous heat producing appliances in the city.

(b) The International Mechanical Code, 2012 2009 Edition (a copy of which, 
authenticated by the signature of the mayor and the city secretary, and made a public 
record by ordinance, is on file in the city secretary’s office), is hereby adopted as the 
mechanical code of the city as fully as if copied at length in this article, but with the 
changes therein and additions thereto provided in this article.

2. Section 18-314 of the Code is amended to read as follows:

     Sec. 18-314.  Licensing and registration of contractors.

The International Mechanical Code is amended by adding subsection 106.6 to 
read as follows:

106.6. Licensing.

(a) No person, corporation, firm, or contractor shall engage in the design, 
installation, construction, maintenance, service, repair, alteration or modification of a 
product or of equipment in environmental air conditioning, commercial refrigeration, or 
process cooling or heating systems or ventilation, without first obtaining an air 
conditioning and refrigeration contractor’s license.

(b) To register with the town as a mechanical contractor, an application shall be 
made in writing on forms furnished for that purpose along with a seventy-five dollar 
($75.00 ) registration fee, and filed with the building official.  This application shall 
contain a copy of the person’s state air conditioning and refrigeration license.

Exception: a homesteader homeowner is not required to be licensed as a 
registered contractor to perform work in his own home.



Exhibit A to Ordinance No._______
Page 2 of 3

(c) The air conditioning and refrigeration contractor’s license shall be valid for 
one (1) year from the date of registration.

(d) The contractor shall be subject to the requirements and penalties of the code of 
ordinances of the Town of Addison.

(e) Any  person who  installs, repairs  or  alters



Exhibit A to Ordinance No._______
Page 3 of 3

environmental air conditioning, commercial refrigeration, or process cooling or heating 
systems or ventilation shall be licensed by the State of Texas to perform such work.



   
Combined Meeting   R2d           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Promote Sustainability

AGENDA CAPTION:
Approval of an Ordinance amending the Code of Ordinances of the Town by
amending Chapter 66 (Solid Waste) Article II (Collection and Disposal), Division 2
(Service Charge) by amending Section 66-52 increasing from $12.56 to $12.77
the monthly fee for single family residential garbage collection.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
There is no impact to the Street division operations budget.

BACKGROUND:
The Town has a contract with Waste Management to provide residential garbage
collection to all single-family homes. This contract started October 1, 2000 and
automatically renews for additional five-year periods if neither party requests
termination.

Our contract rate adjusts up or down each year based on the Producer Price Index
(PPI). This increase or reduction, tied to the PPI, has proven to be a fair method of
establishing the collection rate while eliminating the need for the Town Council to
hear an annual rate increase request.

The current PPI increased by 1.7%. A 1.7% increase will increase the monthly
garbage rate from its current $12.56 per home, per month, to $12.77. This
increase will take effect October 1, 2014 and be reflected on the November water
bill. 

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

Attachments
Solid Waste Fee Ordinance



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. _______
Page 1 of 2

TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS

ORDINANCE NO. _______

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS AMENDING 
THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY BY AMENDING 
CHAPTER 66 (SOLID WASTE), ARTICLE II (COLLECTION AND 
DISPOSAL), DIVISION 2 (SERVICE CHARGE) BY AMENDING 
SECTION 66-52 THEREOF BY ADJUSTING THE MANDATORY 
MONTHLY FEE FOR GARBAGE COLLECTION, HAULING AND 
DISPOSAL (CURBSIDE PICKUP) FROM EACH SINGLE DWELLING 
UNIT WITHIN THE CITY FROM $12.30 TO $12.56; PROVIDING THAT 
SUCH INCREASED RATE SHALL TAKE EFFECT ON OCTOBER 1, 
2013; PROVIDING A SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING A 
SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF ADDISON, 
TEXAS:

Section 1. Amendment.  Chapter 66 (Solid Waste), Article II (Collection and 
Disposal), Division 2 (Service Charge) of the Code of Ordinances (the "Code") of the Town of 
Addison, Texas (the "City") is hereby amended as set forth below, and all other chapters, articles, 
sections, subsections, paragraphs, sentences, phrases and words of the Code are not amended but 
are hereby ratified and affirmed.

A. Section 66-52 (Single dwelling units) of Chapter 66, Article II, Division 2 of the 
Code is hereby amended to read as follows (additions are underlined, deletions are struck 
through):

All owners, lessees or persons in possession of residential property shall be 
charged a mandatory monthly fee for garbage collection, hauling and disposal 
from residences situated within the corporate limits of the town as follows:

Curbside pickup for each single dwelling unit, exclusive of sales tax and 
applicable state fees . . . $12.56$12.30.

Section 2. Effective Date of Increase.  The change in the mandatory monthly fee for
garbage collection, hauling and disposal from residences as set forth in Section 1 above shall be 
effective as of October 1, 2013.

Section 3. Savings.  This Ordinance shall be cumulative of all other ordinances of 
the City and shall not repeal any of the provisions of those ordinances except in those instances 
where the provisions of those Ordinances are in direct conflict with the provisions of this 
Ordinance.



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. _______
Page 2 of 2

Section 4. Severability.  The sections, paragraphs, sentences, phrases, clauses and 
words of this Ordinance are severable, and if any section, paragraph, sentence, phrase, clause or 
word in this Ordinance or application thereof to any person or circumstance is held invalid or 
unconstitutional by a Court of competent jurisdiction, such holding shall not affect the validity of 
the remaining portion of this Ordinance, and the City Council hereby declares that it would have 
passed such remaining portion of this Ordinance despite such invalidity, which remaining 
portion shall remain in full force and effect.

Section 5. Effective Date.  This Ordinance shall become effective from and after its 
passage and approval and its publication as may be required by law.

PASSED AND APPROVED by the City Council of the Town of Addison, Texas this 
______ day of September, 2013.

Todd Meier, Mayor

ATTEST:

By:
Chris Terry, City Secretary

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

By:
John Hill, City Attorney



   
Combined Meeting   R2e           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Promote Sustainability

AGENDA CAPTION:
Approval of and authorizing the City Manager to enter into an interlocal agreement
with Dallas County in an amount not to exceed $10,000 for the disposal of
Household Hazardous Waste.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
This item is budgeted in the FY2015 Streets operations budget.

BACKGROUND:
This item would continue our current partnership with Dallas County to properly
dispose of Household Hazardous Waste (HHW). The Town provides curbside
collection of HHW for single-family residents and disposes of that waste through
the Dallas County Home Chemical Collection Center. Multi-family customers drop
HHW off directly at the Collection Center for disposal.

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

Attachments
HHW ILA



HHW Interlocal Agreement for FY2015    Amendment No. 2  Page 1 of 3 

 

 
 
STATE OF TEXAS  §       

§ 
COUNTY OF DALLAS § 
 
 

AMENDMENT NO. 2 
 TO THE HOUSEHOLD HAZARDOUS WASTE INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT 

(The “Agreement”) 
BETWEEN 

DALLAS COUNTY 
 AND 

TOWN OF ADDISON 
(The “City”)  

A MEMBER CITY OF 
THE DALLAS AREA HOUSEHOLD HAZARDOUS WASTE NETWORK 

 
 

WHEREAS, on July 7, 2014 the Dallas County Commissioners Court was briefed on a 
request from the cities of the Dallas Area Household Hazardous Waste Network to renew and revise 
the effective term and specify new fiscal year budgets for the Household Hazardous Waste Program 
Interlocal Agreement (“Agreement”) that permits four additional one-year renewals for a five-year 
total contract term and was authorized by Court Order 2012-1223; and 

 
WHEREAS, Amendment 1, which was authorized by Court Order 2013-1248 to renew and 

extended the FY2013 agreement through FY2014, will expire on September 30, 2014; and 
 
WHEREAS, the proposed Amendment No. 2, along with the attachment, will serve to 

continue the Household Hazardous Waste Program through fiscal year 2015, while updating overall 
program budget amounts and individual city budget limits for the new fiscal year; and   

 
WHEREAS, proposed Amendment No. 2 contains no other changes in the basic terms and 

conditions of the Agreement and incurs no cost to Dallas County;  
 

NOW THEREFORE, by execution of this Amendment No. 2, the Agreement is amended 
hereby with respect to the items and features described in the Articles below. 

 
I.  

PURPOSE 
 
The purpose of this Amendment is to amend the effective term and fiscal year budget of the 
Agreement without change to the basic terms and provisions.  No other sections, provisions, 
clauses or conditions of the Agreement are waived, deleted or changed hereby, and they shall 
remain in full force and effect throughout the term of the Agreement and any duly authorized 
amendments. 
 

 
II. 

AMENDED PROVISIONS 
 
A. The new term of the Agreement shall be October 1, 2014, through September 30, 2015. 



HHW Interlocal Agreement for FY2015    Amendment No. 2  Page 2 of 3 

 

 
 
 
B. The language contained in Paragraph 1, Section IV. City Responsibilities shall be deleted in its 
entirety and replaced with the following language: 

 
1. “A sum not to exceed $________________________________ for disposal, setup, 

operational, capital and transportation costs for HHW collection for residents of the City 
during the period from October 1, 2014 through September 30, 2015. 
a. Collection, setup, and disposal costs will be paid after-the-fact, based on actual usage 

by the City at events and at the collection center. 
b. Operational and capital costs shall be paid quarterly in advance. 
c. In the event of early withdrawal, the operational and capital costs will not be pro-rated for 

partial quarter participation but will become immediately due and payable in full.” 
 

C. The language contained in Exhibit C2014 of the Agreement entitled FY2014 HHW Program 
Budget Summary shall be deleted in its entirety and shall be replaced with the attached Exhibit 
C2015 entitled FY2015 HHW Program Budget Summary. 

 
 
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, by their signatures below, the duly authorized representatives of 

Dallas County and Town of Addison, a member city of the Dallas Area Household Hazardous 
Waste Network, do hereby agree and append this Amendment No. 2 to the Agreement. 
 

EXECUTED THIS the                       day of                                           , 2014. 
 

 
DALLAS COUNTY:     TOWN OF ADDISON: 
 
 
____________________________   ___________________________ 
BY: Clay Lewis Jenkins    BY:  

County Judge     TITLE: 
 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM:* 
Craig Watkins 
District Attorney 
 
Theresa Guerra Snelson 
Chief, Civil Division 
 
 
_____________________________ 
BY: Frank Waite 
            Assistant District Attorney 
 
* By law, the Dallas County District Attorney’s Office may only advise or approve contracts or legal 
documents on behalf of its clients.  It may not advise or approve a contract or legal document on behalf of other 
parties.  Our review of this document was conducted solely from the legal perspective of our client.  Our 
approval of this document was offered solely for the benefit of our client.  Other parties should not rely on this 
approval, and should seek review and approval by their own respective attorney(s)



HHW Interlocal Agreement for FY2015    Amendment No. 2  Page 3 of 3 

 

 
 

Exhibit C2015 
 

FY2015 HHW PROGRAM BUDGET SUMMARY 
 

This exhibit summarizes the total program funding for FY2015 as approved by the Dallas Area 
Household Hazardous Waste Network at its regular meeting on April 17, 2014, and replaces the language 
contained in Amendment 1, Exhibit C2014 of the Household Hazardous Waste Program Interlocal 
Agreement that was authorized by Court Order 2012-1223.   
 

Fixed Costs include personnel expense, operating costs, and capital budget, which are shared by 
the Network cities based on single-family household projections published by North Central Texas Council 
of Governments.   

• Personnel Expense includes all HHW staff salaries and fringe.   
• Operating Expense includes supplies, equipment, advertising, public education, volunteer 

support, staff development, printing, postage, facility maintenance, utilities, and all other direct 
programming costs.   

• Capital Expense includes building repairs, equipment repair or replacement, mechanical 
upgrades, and expansion projects. 

 
Variable costs include estimated direct costs for collection and disposal of hazardous household 

wastes, which vary according to actual usage and are indicated in the budget summary for planning 
purposes only.  Funding for actual collection, contract labor, and disposal costs will be collected 
from the cities after the fact, on an as-used basis.  

• Collection/Mobilization/Disposal Budget includes estimated costs for staging of events, 
recycling services, waste containers, waste transportation, and disposal. 

• Contract Labor Expense is for part-time, seasonal labor provided by the disposal vendor.   
 

Budget adjustments made to the Operational Budget during the term of the agreement shall not 
result in a City Funding amount that exceeds the approved budget total shown herein.  The County may 
make line item transfers within the operating budget when these transfers do not exceed $5,000.  Budget 
adjustments in excess of $5,000 must be approved by the HHW Network. 
 

BUDGET SECTION CITY FUNDING 

FIXED COSTS (OPERATIONAL BUDGET)  

 Personnel Costs $   403,093 

 Operating Costs $   225,475 

 Capital Expense $     20,000 

  Sub-Total $   625,568 

ESTIMATED VARIABLE COSTS                      
(COLLECTION / LABOR / DISPOSAL BUDGET) 

 
$   869,000 

TOTAL PROGRAM BUDGET $1,517,568 
 



   
Combined Meeting   R2f           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: N/A

AGENDA CAPTION:
Approval of and authorizing the City Manager to execute a renewal contract with
Cobb Fendley & Associates, Inc., to provide professional engineering services; to
authorize additional renewals; and to approve a not to exceed amount of $100,000.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
Funds are available in the Utility and Stormwater Funds and the Street's Division
operating budget.

BACKGROUND:
In November 2012, the Council approved a master service agreement with Cobb
Fendley & Associates to perform professional engineering services in connection
with engineering review for development submittals of plans for private
development as they interface with or connect to the public infrastructure. On
September 24, 2013, the Council renewed that contract for an additional year.
Cobb Fendley has been providing those services on an as-needed basis and staff
has been very pleased with their service and their responsiveness.

The term of the renewal agreement is for the initial year and shall then
automatically renew for a one year period upon its expiration each year unless
either party notifies the other of its decision not to renew the agreement. The
automatic renewals shall occur for up to three additional years following the
expiration of the first renewal term and shall continue and end on August 26, 2018.

Staff recommends that the agreement be renewed for an amount not to exceed
$100,000.

The contract is subject to the final review and approval of the City Attorney and
the City Manager.

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.



   
Combined Meeting   R2g           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Mindful stewardship of Town Resources.
Look for Operational Efficiencies without cutting services

AGENDA CAPTION:
Approval of and authorizing the City Manager to execute a contract with Elite Tree
Service for annual city-wide tree trimming services in an amount not to exceed
$65,000.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
The work under this contract will be funded out of the FY2014-2015 parks
operations budget. A bid tabulation form is attached summarizing the six bids
received by the City of Coppell.

BACKGROUND:
Last year the Town entered into a cooperative purchasing agreement with the City
of Coppell, Texas for the purpose of allowing the Town to engage the services of
Elite Tree Service to provide labor and equipment for performing tree trimming,
tree removal and stump grinding. Elite submitted the lowest total unit cost bid to
the City of Coppell for a one-year annual contract, which is renewable for four
additional years if both parties agree to the terms and conditions of the contract.

Elite Tree Service has successfully completed tree work for the Town over the last
9 years. They responded quickly this year after the ice storm, which helped the
parks department expedite the clean up around town.

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

Attachments
Bid Tabulation Form





   
Combined Meeting   R2h           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Create raving fans of the Addison Experience.
Mindful stewardship of Town Resources.
Maintain and enhance our unique culture of creativity and
innovation.
Raise property values
Attract new businesses to Addison
Brand Protection and Enhancement
Infrastructure improvement and maintenance
Fully integrate the Arts as part of our brand
Implement bond propositions
Promote Sustainability
Enhance Public Safety

AGENDA CAPTION:
Approval of and authorizing the City Manager to enter into a license agreement
with Kennington Surveyor Ltd.(or appropriate property owner) for the use of the
property located adjacent to and along the southwest corner of the intersection of
Arapaho Road and Surveyor Boulevard for the Redding Trail Expansion.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
The Town of Addison will pay ten dollar ($10.00) to Kennington Surveyor Ltd. and
agree to undertake the ongoing maintenance of the constructed Redding Trail
Expansion. Funding for the Redding Trail Expansion is available in bond funds
allocated by Proposition 6 of the 2012 Bond Election.

BACKGROUND:
This agreement will allow the Town of Addison to construct the Redding Trail
Expansion as a part of the Town's Pedestrian Connectivity Project which is funded
by Proposition 6 of the 2012 Bond Election. An attached map identifies this
project as the Beltway and Proton Pedestrian Improvements (Phase 1) which is
highlighted in red.

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

Attachments
KJA Subdivision, Part 2 - Location Map
KJA Subdivision, Part 2 - Property Survey



KJA Subdivision, Part 2 - Proposed Trail Exhibit
KJA Subdivision, Part 2 - Trail Map with Property Identified
Pedestrian Connectivity Project Map











REDDING TRAIL EXPANSION

BELT LINE RD.

ARAPAHO RD.

MORMAN LN.

BELTWAY DR.

SU
RV

EYO
R BLV

D
.

KJA 
SUBDIVISION

PART 2





   
Combined Meeting   R3           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Create and Implement a strategy for Town Owned Real Estate

AGENDA CAPTION:
Discussion, consider and take action regarding appointment of a Member to the
Planning and Zoning Commission.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
N/A

BACKGROUND:
Historically, each council member recommends an individual to appoint to a seat
on the Planning and Zoning Commission, which is considered and voted on by the
rest of Council.

The recommendation for the seat belongs to Council Member Clemens.

RECOMMENDATION:



   
Combined Meeting   R4           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Create raving fans of the Addison Experience.

AGENDA CAPTION:
Discussion and update regarding Oncor service reliability efforts in the Town of
Addison.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
N/A

BACKGROUND:
N/A

RECOMMENDATION:



   
Combined Meeting   R5           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Mindful stewardship of Town Resources.
Infrastructure improvement and maintenance

AGENDA CAPTION:
Presentation, discussion, consider and take action regarding the approval of an
Ordinance amending the Code of Ordinances of the City by amending Chapter
82(Utilities), Article I (In General), Division 5 (Rates and Charges) by amending
Section 82-76 and Section 82-77 increasing sewer and water rates for all
customer classifications.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
N/A

BACKGROUND:
N/A

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

Attachments
Utility Rate Ordinance (Marked)



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 1 of 4

TOWN OF ADDISON,TEXAS

ORDINANCE NO. __________

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS AMENDING 
CHAPTER 82 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN BY 
AMENDING SEWER RATES AND WATER RATES FOR ALL 
CUSTOMER CLASSIFICATIONS; PROVIDING THAT THE CHANGES 
TO THE SEWER RATES AND THE WATER RATES MADE HEREIN 
SHALL BE APPLIED TO MONTHLY CUSTOMER BILLS BEGINNING 
WITH THE NOVEMBER 2014 BILLING CYCLE; PROVIDING A 
SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; 
PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, the Town of Addison, Texas (the "City") is a home rule municipality 
having full power of local self government pursuant to Article 11, Section 5 of the Texas 
Constitution and its Home Rule Charter; and

WHEREAS, the City Council is authorized by Section 2.08.p. of the City Charter to 
provide for a sanitary sewer and water system, and the City is authorized by law (including, 
without limitation, Sections 552.001 and 552.017, Tex. Loc. Gov. Code) to own, construct and 
operate a water and sewer system and to prescribe rates therefor; and

WHEREAS, adjustments to the City’s water and sewer utility rates have been proposed 
by Dallas Water Utilities and Trinity River Authority, respectively; and

WHEREAS, the City has conducted a review and evaluation of the City’s water and 
sewer utility rates and has determined therefrom that the rates need to be adjusted as set forth 
herein to support the operating, maintenance, and capital needs of the City’s water and sewer
utility system.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
TOWN OF ADDISON, TEXAS:

Section 1. The Code of Ordinances (the "Code") of the Town of Addison, Texas (the 
"City") is hereby amended as follows (additions are underlined, deletions are struck through):

A. Chapter 82 (Utilities), Article I (In General), Division 5 (Rates and Charges) of 
the Code is hereby amended in part as follows:

1. Section 82-76 (Sewage rates) of the Code is amended by amending subsections 
(1) (Sewer minimum bills) and (2) (Sewer volume rate) thereof to hereafter read as 
follows:

(1) Sewer minimum bills. Minimum monthly bill shall be applied to all customers 
based upon customer classification and shall include an allowance for volume based 
upon water consumed as follows:



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 2 of 4

Customer
Classification:

Minimum 
Monthly Bill

Volume
Included 
(Gallons)

Single-Family Residential $13.35 13.34 2,000

Multifamily Residential Large (meter 
size greater than or equal to two inches)

166.52 166.28 37,000

Multifamily Residential Small (meter size 
less than two inches)

70.25  70.15 15,000

Schools 92.13  92.00 20,000

Municipal 48.36 48.30 10,000

Commercial Large (meter size greater 
than or equal to two inches)

166.52 166.28 37,000

Commercial Small (meter size less than 
two inches)

26.48  26.45 5,000

Industrial Large (meter size greater 
than or equal to two inches)

166.52 166.28 37,000

Industrial Small (meter size less than
two inches)

17.73  17.71 3,000

Hotel/Motel 442.23 441.58 100,000

(2) Sewer volume rate. All volume which exceeds the amount allowed in the 
minimum bill shall be charged at a rate of $4.38 4.37 per 1,000 gallons of water 
consumed for all customer classifications.

2. Section 82-77 (Water rates) of the Code is amended to hereafter read as follows:

(1) Water minimum bills. Minimum monthly bill shall be applied to all customers 
based upon customer classification and shall include an allowance for volume based 
upon water consumed as follows:

Customer
Classification:

Minimum 
Monthly Bill

Volume
Included 
(Gallons)

Single-Family Residential $10.74 10.66 2,000

Multifamily Residential Large (meter size greater than 
or equal to two inches)

93.63 92.13 37,000

Multifamily Residential Small (meter size less than two 
inches)

41.53  40.92 15,000

Schools 53.37 52.55 20,000

Municipal 29.68 29.28 10,000

Commercial Large (meter size greater than or equal 
to two inches)

93.63 92.13 37,000



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 3 of 4

Commercial Small (meter size less than two inches) 17.84 17.64 5,000

Industrial Large (meter size greater than or equal to 
two inches)

93.63 92.13 37,000

Industrial Small (meter size less than two inches) 13.11 12.98 3,000

Hotel/Motel 242.84 238.77 100,000

Irrigation Large (meter size greater than or equal to 
two inches)

192.34 190.71 40,000

Irrigation Small (meter size less than two inches) 75.88 75.27 15,000

Fire Meters 24.95 24.62 8,000

(2) Water volume rate. All volume which exceeds the amount allowed in the 
minimum bill shall be charged at a rate of $2.37 2.33 per 1,000 gallons of water 
consumed for all customer classifications, with the exceptions as noted in subsection 
(3) below.

(3) Water conservation volume rate. Single-family residential customers shall be 
charged a rate of $4.66 4.62 per 1,000 gallons of water for all water consumed in 
excess of 15,000 gallons. Irrigation (large and small) customers shall be charged for 
all volume, which exceeds the amount allowed in the minimum bill, at a rate of $4.66
4.62 per 1,000 gallons of water consumed.

Section 2. Savings; Repealer.  This Ordinance shall be cumulative of all other 
ordinances of the City and shall not repeal any of the provisions of those ordinances except in 
those instances where the provisions of those Ordinances are in direct conflict with the 
provisions of this Ordinance.  Provided, however, that the repeal of such ordinances or parts of 
such ordinances, and the amendments and changes made by this Ordinance, shall not affect any 
right, property or claim which was or is vested in the City, or any act done, or right accruing or 
accrued, or established, or any suit, action or proceeding had or commenced before the time 
when this Ordinance shall take effect; nor shall said repeals, amendments or changes affect any 
offense committed, or any penalty or forfeiture incurred, or any suit or prosecution pending at 
the time when this Ordinance shall take effect under any of the ordinances or sections thereof so 
repealed, amended or changed; and to that extent and for that purpose the provisions of such 
ordinances or parts of such ordinances shall be deemed to remain and continue in full force and 
effect.

Section 3. Severability.  The sections, paragraphs, sentences, phrases, clauses and 
words of this Ordinance are severable, and if any section, paragraph, sentence, phrase, clause or 
word in this Ordinance or application thereof to any person or circumstance is held invalid or 
unconstitutional by a Court of competent jurisdiction, such holding shall not affect the validity of 
the remaining portions of this Ordinance, and the City Council hereby declares that it would have 
passed such remaining portions of this Ordinance despite such invalidity, which remaining 
portions shall remain in full force and effect.



OFFICE OF THE CITY SECRETARY ORDINANCE NO. 
Page 4 of 4

Section 4. Incorporation of Recitals.  The above and foregoing recitals to this 
Ordinance are true and correct and are incorporated herein and made a part of this Ordinance for
all purposes.

Section 5. Effective Date.  This Ordinance shall become effective October 1, 2014
and be applied to monthly customer bills beginning with the November 2014 billing cycle.

PASSED AND APPROVED by the City Council of the Town of Addison, Texas this 
the ____ day of September, 2014.

Todd Meier, Mayor

ATTEST:

By:
Matt McCombs, City Secretary

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

By:
John Hill, City Attorney



   
Combined Meeting   R6           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Mindful stewardship of Town Resources.
Identify opportunities for improved governance

AGENDA CAPTION:
Presentation and discussion regarding an update on the Finance Department
Work Plan.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
N/A

BACKGROUND:
Staff will brief Council on the Finance Department Work Plan.

RECOMMENDATION:

Attachments
Finance Work Plan Memo
Work Plan



To: Lea Dunn, City Manager

From: Eric Cannon, CPA, Chief Financial Officer

Re: Financial work plan for operations, policies, procedures and internal controls

Date: September 18, 2014

Accounts Payable:

Vendor Master File – The process has been modified. All vendor maintenance is processed by the Purchasing 
Agent (Caitlan Smelley). System Administrative rights have been updated to ensure that only the Purchasing 
Agent has access to modify vendor information.

Training – Finance is having its first training on September 25th.  The goal for this meeting is to continue to train 
Finance employees on policy and procedures. All new hires will be responsible for learning the policies and 
ensuring they are in compliance.  Additionally, Finance plans to implement an annual town-wide training to 
focus on best practices, problem areas, and new requirements.

Receipt Slip/Form – Going forward, it is required that when an individual is receiving and taking possession of 
goods, they must verify the following: quantity, price, and quality of such goods. If a receipting slip is not 
provided for the goods, a Standard Form created by Finance must be completed in place of a receipt. This 
document must be attached to the purchase order before processing. 

Purchasing:

Policy – As Council may recall, Finance completely revamped the purchasing policy in 2013 with the help of 
purchasing consultant Carol Cooper. Finance continues to work on the implementation of this policy and 
believes that the newly authorized positions will help to ensure compliance. Management is also reviewing 
technology options that would better assist staff in adhering to the policy. (Technology being reviewed includes 
BidSync and ERP.)

Purchase Orders - The Finance Department has communicated with all departments about the new initiative to 
reduce the reliance on the payment authorization memo (PAM). Finance will be working with all departments on 
implementing this in a way that will not impede workflow, but will ensure compliance with our policies. 

Purchase Cards – Finance has scheduled training to educate all p-card users on acceptable practices and their 
responsibilities as cardholders. The Town is also working with Gradient Solutions to provide continuous 
monitoring alerts; this will provide staff with the ability to identify any transactions that seem to be 
circumventing the policy. 

MEMO



Banking:

Frost Bank – Finance has updated all of our signature card information to reflect the current appropriate 
individuals.  Additionally, Finance closed or cancelled all other access points or features, excluding Cash 
Manager, a secure online program.  Using Cash Manager for all banking processes provides a detailed and secure 
audit trail.

RFP for Banking Services – A bid was awarded to Valley View Consulting to provide consulting services for 
Finance’s upcoming bid process.  Finance has made contact with several local banks in order to encourage their 
participation for the upcoming request for proposals (RFP).  In addition, Finance is ensuring that the selected 
provider will deliver provisional credit for our Loomis cash management systems throughout the Town. 

Loomis – Finance is in the process of adding a cash management system in various locations throughout the 
Town; this will provide a secure location for the town’s cash receipting process and increase the control 
environment.  

Payroll:

Outsourcing Payroll – Finance recently meet with ADP to learn more about the services they could provide 
regarding payroll outsourcing. Further, Finance is scheduled to have a business process review later this month 
with the intention of receiving projected costs to use in the evaluation.  After this process, if Finance determines 
that outsourcing the payroll function has the ability to provide the Town with the same or greater level of service 
for an acceptable cost, Finance will then begin the RFP process to identify the most capable vendor.

Move Payroll to Finance – Lisa Khaleghipour has been transferred from the Human Resources Department to the
Finance Department. This change took place in mid-August 2014. Since that time, Finance has worked with HR 
to ensure the appropriate training is received to complete the necessary items that are associated with the payroll 
process.

Segregate Duties – Finance has had several meetings with Human Resources to identify what processes/steps 
must remain in the HR department.  Currently, only HR (not Finance) has the ability to modify an employee’s 
master file.

Cash Handling/Receipting:

Cash – As mentioned earlier, the Town is in the process of installing and implementing Loomis cash 
management systems at appropriate locations.  This will remove the risk assumed by General Services personnel, 
who are currently responsible for providing cash carrier services between locations.

A/R – The Town is currently working with a local depository (Frost Bank) to forward all recurring payments 
received to a Town lockbox. Another function that Finance is looking to implement is the use of remote capture 
at all locations.

Fixed Assets:

Inventory – Our intention is to hire a vendor to complete a Town-wide inventory of all listed assets. Although 
Finance is only in the beginning stages of this process, this will be one of the Assistant Finance Director’s 
priorities. 



Tracking in Enterprise Resource Planning (ERP) – After the completion of our 3rd party inventory count, Finance 
will begin adding the individual assets to the current ERP system. This will be a time-consuming process, but it 
will be a major accomplishment once completed. Going forward, Finance will import this updated ledger into the 
new ERP system and utilize the new technology to track this information on a continual basis. 

Segregation of Duties:

Staffing – The Town is currently accepting applications for the Accounting Manager position. This position will 
be responsible for maintaining the general ledger and internal control environment. This individual will also be 
instrumental in implementing the Fixed Asset Module as well as continuously reviewing system access within 
the ERP. 

Assistant Finance Director (AFD) – Finance has recently filled this position. His arrival will greatly reduce the 
reliance on the Chief Financial Officer (CFO) and will allow the delegation of some responsibilities and increase 
the internal control environment.

Information Technology:

Review User Privileges – Finance and Information Technology have already updated the most critical areas as 
identified by Mr. Kanter and staff. This process is still in progress and will be completed by the recently hired 
AFD.

System Changes – All system administrative changes have to be approved by the CFO and Information 
Technology Director. This approval is documented and filed for safe keeping.



Area Task Rationale Owner Schedule Status Continuous Monitoring
Accounts Payable Remove vendor setup Segregation of Duties Eric Cannon October 1, 2014 Completed

Training Compliance Caitlan Smelley Immediately and On-going In progress

Receiving Slip/Approval form Validation of goods received Eric Cannon October 1, 2014
Implementation set for October 1, 2014, training 
scheduled for September 25, 2014

Purchasing Vendor Master File maintenance Segregation of Duties Caitlan Smelley October 1, 2014 Completed X

Purchase Orders Increased control of budget appropriation Caitlan Smelley May 1, 2015
Currently reviewing and identifying vendors that are 
appropriate purchase orders.

X

Purchase Cards Increase Accountability/Compliance Caitlan Smelley January 1, 2015
Developing system to for monthly review/compliance 
audit

X

Interlocal Agreements Ensure best price Caitlan Smelley October 1, 2014 The step has been added to the purchasing process

Banking Update Signature information Mitigate Risk/Control Environment Eric Cannon July, 2014 Completed
Cancel call-in wire feature Mitigate Risk/Control Environment Eric Cannon July, 2014 Completed
Cancel EFT services Mitigate Risk/Control Environment Eric Cannon July, 2014 Completed

RFP for banking services Up for renewal and increase service Eric Cannon July, 2015
In progress, vendor has been selected and work is 
scheduled to begin October 1, 2014

Payroll Outsourceing Payroll Increase controls
Eric Cannon/Passion Hayes

July, 2015
In progress, meeting with qualified vendors for business 
process review and feability

Move Lisa Khaleghipour to Finance Increase controls Eric Cannon August, 2014 Completed
Remove all HR duties from Payroll Specialist Segregation of Duties Steven Glickman/Passion Hayes October 1, 2014 Training HR personal to assume these duties. X

Cash Handling/Receipting Secure Cash Receipts Increase control environment Eric Cannon January 1, 2015
Working through the contract process. Also, working with 
Loomis for installation requirements/certification.

Add all reoccurring payments to Lockbox Mitigate Risk/Efficiency Eric Cannon January 1, 2015 Working with Frost Bank

Fixed Assets Select 3rd party to perform fixed assets count Verify current fixed asset ledger Steven Glickman (AFD) Spring 2015 Starting the process October 1, 2014
Implement Fixed Asset Module within GEMS Improve tracking process/financial reporting Steven Glickman (AFD) Spring 2015 Will begin when inventory of current fixed assets have 

Organizational Design and Segregation of Duties: Hire Assistant Finance Director Segregation of Duties Eric Cannon Start Date September 18th Scheduling final interview next week

Hire Accounting Manager Segregation of Duties Eric Cannon/AFD As soon as possible Waiting approval from Council

Municipal Court
Separate reconciliations from money handling 
functions

Segregation of Duties Paula Dale October 1, 2014
Process has been identified and will take affect at the start 
of the fiscal year.

Secure Cash Receipts Increase control environment Eric Cannon
In progress; Hopeful that units will be 

installed and operational by January 1, 2015
Analyzing Cost/Benefit per location, reviewing contract 
with Loomis.

Information Technology Review & update employee access to GEMS Segregation of Duties Steven Glickman/Sheryl Donihoo Immediate and On-going Completed most critical items, other items are in progress X



   
Combined Meeting   R7           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Mindful stewardship of Town Resources.
Raise property values
Brand Protection and Enhancement
Infrastructure improvement and maintenance

AGENDA CAPTION:
Discussion, consider and take action regarding approval of and authorizing the
City Manager to execute a contract with Artistic Painting Company for city-wide
painting services in an amount not to exceed $200,000 for painting of the Wheeler
Bridge, Blueprints sculpture, interior Athletic Club areas and park structures, and
discussion regarding traffic control during periods of painting.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
This is a budgeted project in the Parks and Recreation FY 2015 operations budget.

The projects consist of: 

Wheeler Bridge and Guard Rails - $105,0001.

Blueprints Sculpture - $29,0002.

Park Structures - $30,0003.

Athletic Club Interior Areas - $20,0004.

Contingency - $14,0005.

BACKGROUND:
The Town entered into a one year contract this year with Artistic Painting
Company for painting various structures in town, including light poles, traffic signal
poles and buildings. This is a one year contract, which is eligible for renewal for 4
additional years if the terms and conditions of the contract are agreeable to both
parties.

When the Council approved the contract with Artistic, staff was asked to look into
alternatives for painting the bridge and sculpture, to see if there is a coating
system that will retain its color for a longer period of time to avoid the "chalking"
appearance that occurs three to four years after painting. 



Extensive research by the National Highway Administration for steel bridge
coating systems concluded that 2-part polyurethane coating systems are one of
the best for steel load bearing bridges. The product that was specified by HNTB
engineers for both structures when originally constructed is a Sherwin Williams
2-part protective & marine polycoating system, which is ranked as one of the best
available. Artistic Painting Company also highly recommends this product. The
Artistic Painting Company representative recommends that from a structural
perspective, the bridge should be painted at least every 5 years to prevent rust
and corrosion.

Artistic has done excellent work for the town this year on other related painting
projects.

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

Attachments
2-Part Coating System







   
Combined Meeting   R8           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Create raving fans of the Addison Experience.
Mindful stewardship of Town Resources.
Maintain and enhance our unique culture of creativity and
innovation.
Raise property values
Attract new businesses to Addison
Brand Protection and Enhancement
Infrastructure improvement and maintenance
Fully integrate the Arts as part of our brand
Implement bond propositions
Promote Sustainability
Enhance Public Safety

AGENDA CAPTION:
Discussion, consider and take action regarding approval of and authorizing the
City Manager to execute a Project Specific Agreement with Dallas County for the
Redding Trail Expansion.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
The Redding Trail Expansion is funded by Proposition 6 of the 2012 Bond
Election. The Project Specific Agreement with Dallas County will provide the Town
of Addison with matching funds (not to exceed $237,000.00 or 50% of the project
total) to construct the trail. 

Based on the awarded bid of $228,836.56, it is anticipated that the amount of
matching funds will be $114,418.28 from Dallas County.

BACKGROUND:
The Redding Trail Expansion is a part of the Pedestrian Connectivity Project
(Phase 1) which is funded by Proposition 6 of the 2012 Bond Election.

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.

Attachments
Dallas County PSA
Pedestrian Connectivity Project Map
Proposition 6 CIP Funds



Proposition 6 CIP Funds

















































Pedestrian Connectivity Project 8/20/2014
Proposition 6 - 2012 Bond Election

Pedestrian Connectivity Funding Sources Amount Status
Proposition 6 - 2012 Bond Election 3,500,000.00
Matching Trail Funding - Dallas County 114,418.28 Matching not to exceed $237,100
Pedestrian Connectivity CIP Funding - Beltway, Proton and South Quorum 440,900.00 Street and Lighting Improvements
Total Pedestrian Connectivity Funding 4,055,318.28

Design Charrette
Design Workshop -$24,500.00 Complete
Talley Associates -$20,000.00 Complete
Mesa Design Group -$24,500.00 Complete

North and South Quorum Design
Talley Associates - Survey -$87,120.00 Complete
Talley Associates - Schematic Design -$70,964.00 Complete
Talley Associates - Construction Documents -$72,072.00 Under Design; Project Bidding to begin November 2014

Beltway/Proton Design
Mesa Design Group - Survey -$25,000.00 Complete
Mesa Design Group - Schematic Design -$50,670.00 Complete
Mesa Design Group - Construction Documents -$231,640.00 Under Design; Project Bidding to begin November 2014

Construction 
Redding Trail Expansion -$228,836.56 Bids received; Grand Opening in  Jan. 2015
Beltway and Proton Enhancements -$2,000,000.00 Under Design; Construction to begin Jan. 2015
South Quorum Lighting -$910,000.00 Under Design; Construction to begin Jan. 2015
Total Pedestrian Connectivity Balance 310,015.72 Unallocated funds

*Updated: 11/13/2013; 6/20/2014; 7/23/2014; 8/11/2014; 8/12/2014; 8/20/2014



   
Combined Meeting   R9           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: N/A

AGENDA CAPTION:
Discussion, consider and take action regarding the Vision Statement for the Town
of Addison.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
N/A

BACKGROUND:
During the June 27 and 28 Strategic Planning retreat, the July 8 work session, the
Sept 15 work session, and the Sept 18 work session, Council discussed a series
of statements and goals that would ultimately be used to formulate this Council’s
vision statement for the Town. The final vision statement will serve as the guiding
principal for Council’s future policy discussions and decisions. 

RECOMMENDATION:



   
Combined Meeting   ES1           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Increase Revenues by at least 10% while holding the tax rate
to $0.58 or less and reserves to at least 30%.
Create raving fans of the Addison Experience.
Mindful stewardship of Town Resources.
Raise property values
Attract new businesses to Addison

AGENDA CAPTION:
Closed (Executive) session of the Addison City Council pursuant to Section
551.087, Texas Government Code, to discuss or deliberate regarding commercial
or financial information that the City Council has received from a business
prospect or business prospects that the City Council seeks to have locate, stay, or
expand in our near the territory of the Town of Addison and with which the City
Council is conducting economic development negotiations, and/or to deliberate
the offer of a financial or other incentive to such business prospect or business
prospects.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
N/A

BACKGROUND:
N/A

RECOMMENDATION:



   
Combined Meeting   R10           
Meeting Date: 09/23/2014  

Council Goals: Increase Revenues by at least 10% while holding the tax rate
to $0.58 or less and reserves to at least 30%.
Create raving fans of the Addison Experience.
Mindful stewardship of Town Resources.
Raise property values
Attract new businesses to Addison

AGENDA CAPTION:
Discussion, consider and take action regarding commercial or financial information
that the City Council has received from a business prospect or business prospects
that the City Council seeks to have locate, stay, or expand in or near the territory
of the Town of Addison and with which the City Council is conducting economic
development negotiations, and/or any action regarding the offer of a financial or
other incentive to such business prospect or business prospects.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
N/A

BACKGROUND:
N/A

RECOMMENDATION:
Administration recommends approval.


	Agenda
	WS2_ACTC Catering Policy Update
	WS1_Draft Vision Statement
	WS1_ATT_Draft Vision Statement
	R2a_09-09-2014 Minutes
	R2a_ATT_09-09-2014 Minutes
	R2b_Fire Code Updates
	R2b_ATT_Fire Code Amendments Ordinance
	R2b_ATT_2012 IFC Changes
	R2c_Adoption of 2012 International Building Codes & 2014 National Electrical Code
	R2c_ATT_2012 IBC MEMO
	R2c_ATT_2012 IBC ORD
	R2c_ATT_2012 IRC MEMO
	R2c_ATT_2012 IRC ORD
	R2c_ATT_2012 IPMC MEMO
	R2c_ATT_2012 IPMC ORD
	R2c_ATT_2014 NEC MEMO
	R2c_ATT_2014 NEC ORD
	R2c_ATT_2012 IPC MEMO
	R2c_ATT_2012 IPC ORD
	R2c_ATT_2012 IMC MEMO
	R2c_ATT_2012 IMC ORD
	R2d_Solid Waste Fee Increase
	R2d_ATT_Solid Waste Fee Ordinance
	R2e_Household Hazardous Waste FY15
	R2e_ATT_HHW ILA
	R2f_Cobb Fendley Contract Renewal
	R2g_Annual Contract - Tree Trimming Services
	R2g_ATT_Bid Tabulation Form
	R2h_License Agreement with Kennington Surveyor
	R2h_ATT_KJA Subdivision, Part 2 - Location Map
	R2h_ATT_KJA Subdivision, Part 2 - Property Survey
	R2h_ATT_KJA Subdivision, Part 2 - Proposed Trail Exhibit
	R2h_ATT_KJA Subdivision, Part 2 - Trail Map with Property Identified
	R2h_ATT_Pedestrian Connectivity Project Map
	R3_P&Z Appointment
	R4_Oncor Reliability
	R5_Update Water and Sewer Rates
	R5_ATT_Utility Rate Ordinance (Marked)
	R6_Finance Work Plan
	R6_ATT_Finance Work Plan Memo
	R6_ATT_Work Plan
	R7_Parks and Infrastructure City-wide Painting
	R7_ATT_2-Part Coating System
	R8_Dallas County for the Redding Trail Expansion
	R8_ATT_Dallas County PSA
	R8_ATT_Pedestrian Connectivity Project Map
	R8_ATT_Proposition 6 CIP Funds
	R9_Draft Vision Statement
	ES1_Chapter 380 Incentive Discussion
	R10_Chapter 380 Incentives Action Item

